
The Complete Home Energy Angler.
Wednesday, March 2, 7–9 p.m.

Drake Centre, 802 W. Drake Rd. 
(Pre-registration is not necessary for this free program.) 

If you’re among the many people fishing for 
savings, this program will help you discover 
energy-saving opportunities just waiting to be 
reeled in. 

Work with local specialists on an inventory 
tool to identify where you use energy in your 
home. Develop steps to help you start saving 
immediately as well as in the long run.

Hear about substantial incentives available        
for energy-efficiency improvements and 
replace energy-saving myths with proven                    
cost-effective strategies.

Learn how you can participate in the newly 
created Fort Collins Community Energy 
Challenge. Discover how your actions can      
save you money and energy and contribute         
to a healthier community.

 

2011 Residential 
 Environmental Program Series.

Please help us make this a zero-waste event.  
 Series sponsored by Fort Collins Utilities and Natural Resources Department 

Presenters

•	 Norm Weaver, Fort Collins Utilities Energy 
Services, will teach you how to estimate 
electricity use around your home and present 
tips for energy savings.

•	 Ariana Friedlander, The Atmospheric 
Conservancy, will introduce the Community 
Energy Challenge and explain how you          
can participate.

For more information, visit fcgov.com/reps,   
e-mail utilities@fcgov.com, call (970) 221-6700   
or TDD (970) 224-6003. 


