_FortCollins

r
y,
/

2009 [BC

A MENDMENTS

September 15, 2010

PLANNING, DEVELOPMENT AND TRANSPORTATION
P.O. BOX 580 281 N COLLEGE AVE FORT COLLINS, CO 80524
970.416.2740 970.224.6134 FAX fcgov.com/nbs/codes.php



ORDINANCE NO. 098, 2010
OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FORT COLLINS
AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 1I, DIVISION 2, OF THE
CODE OF THE CITY OF FORT COLLINS FOR THE PURPOSE OF
REPEALING THE 2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (IBC) AND
ADOPTING THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, WITH AMENDMENTS

WHEREAS, since 1924, the City has reviewed, amended and adopted the latest nationally
recognized building standards available for the times; and

WHEREAS, upon recommendation of City staff, the City Council has determined that it is in
the best interests of the City to align the five interconnected basic construction codes under one
publicatiqn year; and

WHEREAS, the five interconnected basic construction codes are the International Building
Code, International Residential Code, International Mechanical Code, International Fuel Gas Code,
and International Energy Conservation Code; and

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that the 2009 publication year of the five
interconnected basic construction codes ought to be adopted and that their counterpart codes
previously adopted should be repealed both in order to align the publication years of the codes and
also because the 2009 publications contain improvements in construction code regulation; and

WHEREAS, City staff has conducted a significant public outreach program, working with the
regulated construction industry and building professionals; and

WHEREAS, the adoption of the five interconnected basic construction codes has been
presented to and recommended by the Affordable Housing Board, the Commission on Disability, the
Air Quality Advisory Board, the Natural Resources Advisory Board, the Building Review Board, the
Electric Board, the Landmark Preservation Commission and the Water Board; and

WHEREAS, the Council of the City of Fort Collins has determined that it is in the best
interest of the health, safety and welfare of the City and its citizens that the 2006 International
Building Code, as amended be repealed and that in its place, the 2009 International Building Code
should be adopted, with amendments.

{

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FORT

COLLINS as follows: '

Section 1. That Section 5-26(a) of the Code of the City of Fort Collins is hereby amended
to read as follows:



(a) Pursuant to the power and authority conferred on the City Council by Section
31-16-202, C.R.S. and Article II, Section 7 of the Charter, the City Council hereby repeals
the 2006 International Building Code (2006 IBC), and adopts as the building code of the City
the 2009 International Building Code (2009 IBC) published by the International Code
Council, as amended by the City, which shall have the same force and effect as though set

. forth in full herein. The subject matter of the codes adopted herein includes comprehensive
provisions and standards regulating the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair,
moving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, equipment, use, height, area and
maintenance of buildings and structures exclusive of detached one- and two-family dwellings
and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three (3) stories above
grade and their accessory structures, for the purpose of protecting the public health, safety
and general welfare.

Section 2. That Section 5-27 of the Code of the City of Fort Collins is hereby repealed
and reenacted to read as follows: :

Sec. 5-27 . Amendments and deletions to code.

The 2009 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE adopted herein is hereby amended
in the following respects:

(1) Section 101.1 Title is hereby amended to read as:

“101.1. Title. These regulations shall be known as the General Building Code of the City of Fort
Collins, hereinafter referred to as ‘this code’.”

(2) Section 101.4.1 through 101.4.9 Referenced codes, is amended to read as follows:

“101.4.1 Electrical. All references to the Electrical Code shall mean the electrical code currently
in effect as enacted by the State of Colorado.

101.4.2 Gas. All references to the International Fue! Gas Code shall mean the fuel gas code
currently in effect as enacted by the City.

101.4.3 Mechanical. All references to the International Mechanical Code shall mean the
mechanical code currently in effect as enacted by the City.

101.4.4 Plumbing. All references to the International Plumbing Code shall mean the plumbing
code currently in effect as enacted by the State of Colorado.

101.4.5 Property Maintenance. All references to the International Property Maintenance Code
shall mean the property maintenance code currently in effect as enacted by the City.

101.4.6 Fire Prevention. All references to the Internatzonal Fire Code shall mean the fire code
currently in effect as enacted by the City.



101.4.7 Energy. All references to the International Energy Conservation Code shall mean the
energy code currently in effect as enacted by the City.

101.4.8 Residential. All references to the International Residential Code shall mean the
residential code currently in effect as enacted by the City.

101.4. 9 Areas prone to flooding. All references to ‘flood hazard’ and “areas prone to flooding’
in this code and appendices adopted therewith shall be as specified in the Code of the City,
“Chapter 10, Flood Prevention and Protection.”

(3) Section 103 Department of Building Safety is amended in its entirety to read as follows:
“SECTION 103 CODE ADMINISTRATION

“103.1 Entity charged with code administration. The Community Development and
Neighborhood Services Department as established by the Code of the City, is hereby charged
with the administration and enforcement of this code.

The building official, appointed by the City Manager, is charged with the direct overall
administration and enforcement of this code; and, in the performance of said duties, may delegate
the necessary authority to the appropriate technical, administrative, and compliance staff under
the supervision the building official.”

(4) Section 105.2 Work exempt from permits, items 1, 4, 6, 14, 15, 16, 17 under the heading of,
Building, are amended to read as follows:

“Building:

1. One-story detached accessory buildings used for playhouses, lawn and garden equipment
storage, tool storage and similar uses provided such buildings do not exceed 120 square
feet of floor area nor 8 feet in height, do not house flammable liquids in quantities
exceeding 10 gallons per building and are constructed entirely of noncombustible
materials when located less than 3 feet from an adjoining property line.

4. Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1219 mm) in height measured from the low side
grade to the top of the wall provided the horizontal distance to the next uphill retaining
wall is at least equal to the total height of the lower retaining wall, unless supporting a
surcharge or impounding Class I, II or IIIA liquids.

6. Platforms and decks intended for human occupancy or walking, sidewalks and driveways

not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above adjacent grade, and not over any basement
window or story below and are not part of an accessible route.

14. Roofing repair or replacement work not exceeding one square of covering per building.

~
2



13. Minor work valued at.less than $500 and not involving alteration of bearing walls,
structural or fire-rated assemblies, plurnbmg, electrical or mechanical components or fire-
extmculshmg systems.

16. Window replacement requiring no structural alteration and when such work is
determined not to be historically significant or affecting a building more than 50 years
old, storm window, storm door and rain gutter installation.

17. Decorative ponds, fountains and pools which cannot contain water more than 24 inches
(610 mm) deep.”

(5) Delete all headings and references under Electrical, Gas, Mechanical, Plumbing.

(6) Section 105.5 Expiration is hereby amended by adding a second paragraph to read as follows:

“Both prior to and subsequent to the effective date of this code, any work authorized by a permit
regulated by this code, or under any other building construction code administered by the
building official, that involves the construction or alteration of an exterior building component,
assembly or finish material, such as the foundation, wall and roof framing, sheathing, siding,
fenestration, and roof covering, shall be fully completed for permanent outdoor exposure within
24 months of the date of issuance of such permit, regardless of when the permit was issued. -
Failure to comply with the foregoing time period shall constitute a violation of this code,
resulting in revocation of the permit, and shall subject the permit holder and property owner to
all penalties provided by the Code of the City.”

(7) Section 105.8 Premises Identification is added to read as follows:

“105.8 Premises Identification. The approved permit number and street address number shall
be displayed and be plainly visible and legible from the public street or road fronting the property
on which any new building is being constructed.”

(8) Section 105.9 Transfer of permits, is added to read as follows:

“105.9 Transfer of permits. A current valid building permit may be transferred from one party to
another upon written application to the building official. When any changes are made to the original
plans and specifications that substantially differ from the plans submitted with the permit, as
determined by the building official, a new plan review fee shall be paid as calculated in accordance
with Section 109. A fee of $50 shall be paid to cover administrative costs for all building permit
transfers. No change shall be made in the expiration date of the original permit.”

4



(9) Section 107.2.5.2 Information for construction in areas prone to flooding is hereby amended
by adding the following to read as:

-107.2.5.2 Information for construction in areas prone to flooding. “For buildings or
structures regulated under the scope of this code that are in whole or in part located in flood
hazard areas, construction documents shall be submitted as established in accordance with the
Code of the City, Chapter 10, Flood Prevention and Protection.”

(10) Section 107.3.1 Approval of construction documents, is hereby amended to read as;

107.3.1 Approval of construction documents. When the building official issues a permit, the
construction documents shall be approved in writing or by a stamp, One set of construction
documents so reviewed shall be retained by the building official. The other set shall be returned
to the applicant, shall be kept at the site of work and shall be open to inspection by the building
official or his or her authorized representative.

(11) Section 108 Temporary Structures and Uses is deleted in its entirety.
(12) Section 109, FEES, is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows:

“SECTION 109 FEES

109.1 Payment of fees. No permit with any amendments and related construction plans therefor
shall be valid until the fees prescribed by the City Manager pursuant to Chapter 7.5, ARTICLE [
of the Code of the City, entitled, ADMINISTRATIVE FEES, have been paid.

109.2 Related fees. The payment of the fee for the construction, alteration, removal or
demolition for work done in connection with or concurrently with the work authorized by a
building permit shall not relieve the applicant or holder of the permit from the payment of other
fees that are prescribed by law.

109.3 Fee refunds. Any fee paid hereunder that is erroneously paid or collected shall be
refunded. The building official may authorize the refunding of 90 percent of a plan review fee or
building permit fee to the applicant who paid such fee provided the plan review is withdrawn or
cancelled and the plan review and/or work authorized under a permit issued in accordance with
this code has not commenced; and further provided that such plan review or permit is valid and
not expired as set forth in Section 105.5. Prior to authorizing the refunding of any fee paid to the
original applicant or permitee, a written request from such party must be submitted to the City
within 180 days of the date of the fee payment.”

(13) Section 113, Board of Appeals, is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows:
5



“SECTION 113 BOARD OF APPEALS

- 113.1 General. The Building Review Board (hereafter "Board") as established in Section 2-117
of the Code of the City is hereby empowered in accordance with the procedures set forth in this
section to hear and to decide appeals of orders, decisions, or determinations made by the
building official relative to the application and interpretation of this code; to the suitability of
alternative materials or alternative methods of construction; and the granting of permit
extensions and reinstatements as prescribed by Section 105.5. The building official shall be an
ex officio member of the Board without vote and shall serve as the Secretary of the Board. The -
Board shall adopt rules of procedure for conducting its business and shall render all decisions
and findings in writing.

113.2 Applications/Hearings. When a building permit applicant or a holder of a building
permit desires relief from any decision of the building official related to the enforcement of this
code, except as is otherwise limited in Section 113.4, such building permit applicant, building
permit holder, or representative thereof may appeal the decision of the building official to the
Board stating that such decision by the building official was based on an erroneous interpretation
of the building regulations or that an alternative desi gn, alternative materials and/or the
alternative methods of construction proposed by the appellant are equivalent to those prescribed
by this-.code considering structural strength, effectiveness, fire res1stance durability, safety and
any other pertinent factors.

The Board shall hear and decide all appeals made to it and shall have the authority to rule in
favor of the appellant when the Board determines that the interpretation of the building
regulations of the City by the building official was erroneous, or when the Board determines an
alternative design, alternative materials and/or the alternative methods proposed by the appellant
are equivalent to those prescribed by this code considering structural strength, effectiveness, fire
resistance, durability, safety and any other pertinent factors. The Board shall require that
sufficient evidence be submitted to substantiate any claims made regarding the proposed
alternative design, alternative materials and/or alternative methods of construction. A quorum of
4 members shall be necessary for any meeting of the Board.

113.3 Fees and Notification. Persons desiring to appeal to the Board any decision of the
building official as provided in this section shall, at the time of filing such appeal, pay to the City
a filing fee in the amount of $50. Written notice of hearings shall be given to the Appellant and,
with respect to requests for exceptions or variances to Section 1101.1 of this code as enacted by
the City, to the secretary to the Commission on Disability, at least 3 days prior to the hearing by
mailing the same to such party's last known address by regular U.S. mail.

113.4 Limitations. The Building Review Board shall have no authority with respect to any of
the following functions: —
1. The administration of this code except as expressly provided otherwise;

6



2. Waiving requirements of this code, except as provided pursuant to this section;

3. Modifying the applicable provisions of, or granting variances to, this code, or
approving the use of alternative designs, alternative materials and/or alternative
methods of construction except as provided for in this section and based upon a
-specific appeal from a determination or decision of the building official on an
individual case basis; and

4. Modifying, interpreting, or ruling on the applicability or intent of the zoning and land
use regulations or other laws of the City except as expressly empowered otherwise.”

(14) Section 114.4, Violation penalties is amended to read as follows:

“114.4 Violation penalties. Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to comply
with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a building or

. structure in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the building
official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty ofa
misdemeanor subject to the penalties and fines pursuant to Section 1-15 of the Code of the City,
punishable by a fine of not more than $1,000.00 dollars, or by imprisonment not exceeding 180
days, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice
has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.”

(15) Section 114.5 Work bommencing before permit issuance, is added to read as follows:

“114.5 Work commencing before permit issuance. In addition to penalties set forth in
Section 114.4, any person or firm who, before obtaining the necessary permit(s), commences
any construction of, or work on, a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing
system that is not otherwise exempted from obtaining a permit, shall be subject to a
processing and penalty fee in addition to the standard prescribed permit fee. Such additional
fee shall be equal to the permit fee, except that such fee shall not be less than $50 nor more
than $1,000 for the first such violation. A person or firm committing the same such violation
repeatedly is subject to processing and penalty fees equal to double the amount of the permit
fee or double the amount of the preceding violation, whichever is greater, for every same
such subsequent violation committed thereafter within any 180-day period. The foregoing

fees may be appealed to the City Manager pursuant to Chapter 2, Article VI of the Code of
the City.”

(16) Section 202, DEFINITIONS, terms are hereby amended or added in alphabetical sequence in
the following respects:

The term, “DWELLING " is hereby amended to read as follows:
“DWELLING is defined as set forth in the Land Use Code.”

The term, “DWELLING UNIT" is hereby amended to read as follows:

7



“DWELLING UNIT is defined as set forth in the Land Use Code.”

The term, "FAMILY" is added to read as follows:
“FAMILY is defined as set forth in the Land Use Code.”

The term, “GRADE " is hereby added to read as follows:

“GRADE (ADJACENT GROUND ELEVATION). The lowest point of elevation of the
finished surface of the ground, paving or sidewalk with the area between the building and the
property line or, when the property line is more than 5 feet (1.524 m) from the building,
between the building and a line 5 feet (1.524 m) from the building.”

The term, “ROOM, SLEEPING " is added to read as follows:

“ROOM, SLEEPING (BEDROOM). A habitable room within a dwelling or other housing
unit designed primarily for the purpose of sleeping. The presence of a bed, cot, mattress,
convertible sofa or other similar furnishing used for sleeping purposes is indicia for
determining that such space or room qualifies as a sleeping room. The presence of closets
and similar storage facilities are not considered as relevant factors in determining whether or
not a room is a sleeping room.”

The term, “TOWNHOUSE " is amended to read as follows:

“TOWNHOUSE. A single-family dwelling unit constructed as part of a group of 2 or more
attached individual dwelling units, each of which is separated from the other from the
foundation to the roof and is located entirely on a separately recorded and platted parcel of
land (site) bounded by property lines, and which parcel is deeded exclusively for such single-
family dwelling.”

(17) Section 419.1General is amended to read as follows:
“419.1 General. A live/work unit is a dwelling unit or sleeping unit in which a significant
portion of the space includes a nonresidential use that is operated by the tenant and shall
comply with Sections 419.1 through 419.8.
EXCEPTION:

Dwelling or sleeping units that include an office that is less than 20 percent of the area of the
dwelling unit shall not be classified as a live/work unit.”



(18) Section 505.2 Area Limitation 1s amended by adding a new exception number 3 to read as
follows:

“3. Within individual dwelling units of Group R occupancies, the maximum aggregate area of

a mezzanine may be equal to one-half of the area of the room in which it is located, without

being considered an additional story; and to allow the mezzanine to be closed to the room

in which it is located, provided exits from the mezzanine are in conformance with Section
505.3.” '

(19) Section 705.3 Buildings on the same lot is amended by adding a third paragraph to read as
follows:

“Lines or walls which are established solely to delineate individual portions of a building or of
a planned unit development (PUD)}) need not be considered as property lines for the purposes
of this code, provided that such building is entirely located on property which is under

common ownership and further provided that required distances, set forth in Section 503.1.2 for

assumed property lines between buildings located on the same property, are maintained.”

(20) Section 902.1 Definitions is amended by adding a new definition to read as follows:

“FIRE CONTAINMENT AREA is a portion of a story or basement which is totally enclosed
by not less than one-hour fire-resistive construction and as prescribed in Section 709, entitled
‘Fire Partitions’ and Section 710, entitled ‘Smoke Barriers.’

Openings other than doors and ducts shall be protected as specified in Section 715.5 and shall be
limited to a maximum of 25 percent of any one (1) wall. Self-closing devices may be used in
place of automatic closing devices on doors unlikely to be fixed open during normal conditions.
Examples are doors at toilet rooms, closets and small storage rooms and similar areas.”

(21) Section 903.2 Where required, is amended by adding an exception number 2 to read as
" follows:

“2. Except for Occupancies with a Group R fire area in accordance with Section 903.2.8, an
automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in all buildings which are not divided into fire
containment areas as specified in Table 903.1.”

(22) Section 903.2.7 Group M Item #4 is amended to read as follows:

“4. A Group M occupancy with a total combined floor area of more than 5,000 square feet and is
used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture.”



(23) Table 903.1 Maximum Allowable Fire-Containment Area is added as follows:

“TABLE 903.1
MAXIMUM ALLOWABLE FIRE-CONTAINMENT AREA
(IN SQUARE FEET)

Tvpes of Construction

| Occupancy | 1A | IB | IA |IIB{lllA [HIB[IV-HT| v4 | vB

A1 10,000{10,000] NP| NP| NP| NP{ NP[ NP| NP
A2, 110,000 {10,000 | 5,000{5,000] 5,000{5,000{ 5,000 5,000 5,000
A3,4  [10,000]10,000[ 5,000/5,000[ 5,000(s,000 5,000[ 5,000(s,000
B 1St Szfm,ooo“lo,ooo 7,000 ’5,000‘ 7,000'is,oooi 7,oool 7,0001 5,000
F2 20,000 20,000110,000[7,00010,000{7,00010,000[10,000 5,000
IE 110,000 {10,000 7,000{5,000| 7,000{5,000| 7,000 7,000{ 5,000
NP = Not Permitted
EXCEPTION:

S2 Open parking garages in accordance with Section 406.3.”

(24) Section 907.2.11 Single- and multiple-station smoke alarms is amended by adding a
second paragraph thereto to read as follows:

When one or more sleeping rooms are added or created in existing Group R Occupancies, the
entire dwelling unit shall be provided with smoke detectors located and installed as required
for new Group R Occupancies described herein.”

(23) Section 907.9 through 907.11 Carbon monoxide detection is amended by adding three new
sections to read as follows: :

“907.9 Carbon monoxide alarms. For new construction, an approved carbon monoxide alarm
shall be installed outside of each separate sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of the
bedrooms in dwelling units within which fuel-fired appliances are installed and in dwelling
units that have attached garages.

907.10 Where required in existing dwellings. Where work requiring a permit occurs in
existing dwellings that have attached garages or in existing dwellings within which fuel-fired
appliances exist, carbon monoxide alarms shall be provided in accordance with Section
R315.1.

10



907.11 Alarm requirements. Single station carbon monoxide alarms shall-be listed as
complying with UL 2034 and shall be installed in accordance with this code and the
manufacturer’s installation instructions.”

(26) Section 1007.3 Stairways, Exceptions 1, 2 & 3 are amended to read as follows:

“EXCEPTIONS:

1. The area of refuge is not required at open exit access or exit stairways as permitted by
Sections 1016.1 and 1022.1 in buildings not more than 4 stories above grade plane, that are
equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section
903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.

2. The clear width of 48 inches (1219 mm)}) between handrails is not required at exit access
stairway as permitted by Section 1016.1or exit stairways in buildings not more than 4 stories
above grade plane, equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system 1nsta11ed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.

3. Areas of refuge are not required at exit stairways in buildings not more than 4 stories
above grade plane, equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.”

(27) Section 1007.4 Elevators is amended by adding a new exception #5 to read as:

“5. Elevators in buildings not more than 4 stories above grade plane are not required to be
considered an accessible means of egress when the building is equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.”

(28) Section 1007.8 Two-way communication exception #I is amended to read as follows:

“EXCEPTION:
1. Two-way communication systems are not required at the elevator landing of buildings not
required to provide areas of refuge in accordance with Section 1007.6.3.”

(29) Section 1008.1.5 Floor elevation is amended by adding a second paragraph to read as
follows:

“All exterior steps, slabs, walks, decks and patios serving as exterior door landings or
exterior stairs shall be adequately and permanently secured in place by approved methods
to prevent such landings or stairs from being undermined or subject to significant
displacement due to improper placement of supporting backfill or due to inadequate
anchoring methods.”

11



(30) Section 1008.1.5 Floor elevation is amended by adding a new, Exception 6, to read as follows:

“6. Exterior doors serving individual dwelling units, other than the main entrance door to a
dwelling unit, may open at one intervening exterior step that is equally spaced between the
interior floor level above and exterior landing below, provided that the step has a minimum

“tread depth of 12 inches, a maximum riser height of 7 % inches (7.75"), and a minimum
width equal to the door width, and further provided that the door does not swing over the
step.”

(31) Section 1009.12 Handrails is amended to read as follows:

1009.12 Handrails. Stairways of more than one riser shall have handrails on each side and
shall comply with Section 1012. Where glass is used to provide the handrail, the handrail
shall also comply with Section 2407.”

(32) Section 1013.7 Below grade openings is amended by adding a new section read as follows:

“1013.7 Below grade openings. All area wells; stair wells and light wells attached to any
building that are located less than 36 inches from the nearest intended walking surface and
deeper than 36 inches below the surrounding ground level, creating an opening with a
horizontal dimension greater than 24 inches measured perpendicular from the building, with
the side walls of such well having a slope steeper than 2 horizontal to 1 vertical, shall be
protected with guardrails conforming to this Section areund the entire opening, or be provided
with an equivalent barrier.

EXCEPTIONS: ‘
1. The access side of stairways need not be barricaded.

2. Area wells provided for emergency escape and rescue windows may be protected with
approved grates or covers that comply with Section 1029.4 of this code.

3. Covers and grates may be used over stairways and other openings used exclusively for
service access or for admitting light or ventilation.”

(33) Section 1029.1 General Exceptions 1 and 2 are hereby deleted, exceptions 3 through 7 are
renumbered and amended to read as follows:

“l. The emergency escape and rescue opening is permitted to open onto a balcony within an
atrium in accordance with the requirements of Section 404, provided the balcony provides
access to an exit and the dwelling unit or sleeping unit has a means of egress that is not open to
the atrium. '

2. Basements with a ceiling height of less than 72 inches (1829 mm) shall not be required to
have emergency escape and rescue windows.

3. High-rise buildings in accordance with Section 403.

12



4. Emergency escape and rescue openings are not required from basements or sleeping rooms
that have an exit door or exit access door that opens directly into a public way or to a yard, court
or exterior exit balcony that opens to a public way.

5. Basements without habitable spaces and having no more than 200 square feet (18.6m?) in
floor area shall not be required to have emergency escape windows.”

(34) Section 1029.5.1 Window Wells is amended by adding a new exception to read as follows:
“EXCEPTION:

With the window in the full open position, the bottom window well step may encroach a
maximum of 12 inches (304 mm) into the minimum horizontal projection, provided the well
meets the following criteria:

1. The bottom of the well is not less than 36 inches wide (914 mm), centered

horizontally on the openable portion of the emergency escape and rescue door or window,

and

2. An unobstructed clear horizontal projection of 36 inches (914 mm) is maintained at
the centerline of the openable portion of the emergency escape and rescue door or
window.”

(35) Section 1101.2 Design is amended to read as follows:

“1101.2 Design. Buildings and facilities shall be designed and constructed to be accessible in
accordance with this code and the most recently published edition of ANSI A117.1 as
referenced by the building official.”

(36) Section 1103.1 Where required is amended by adding a second and third paragraphs to
read as follows:

“Nothing in this code shall be construed as relieving or waiving compliance with Colorado law
as set forth in Section 9-5-101 et seq., CR.S.

When the Building Review Board considers granting exceptions or variances either to this
chapter pursuant to Section 113 of this code or to Colorado Statutes pursuant to Section 9-5-
102, C.R.S,, it shall require the applicant requesting the exception or variance to demonstrate
that the application of a particular standard or specification relating to access for persons with
disabilities would impose an extraordinary hardship on the subject property. For the purposes
of this Section, an extraordinary hardship shall mean a substantial and unusual hardship which
is the direct result of unique physical site conditions such as terrain, topography or geology; or,
which is the direct result of other unique or special conditions encountered on the subject
property, but which are not typically encountered elsewhere in the City. Constraints,
complications or difficulties that may arise by complying with this chapter and/or with the

13



statutory standards for accessibility but that do not constitute an extraordinary hardship shall
not serve to justify the granting of an exception or variance.”

(37) Section 11 07.2 Deszgn is amended by adding a second and third paragraph to read as
follows:

“When any building or buildings, classified as Group R, Division 1 or Group R, Division 2
Occupancy, are constructed as a single building project (or any phase thereof) on any one site
and such building project (or phase) contains one or more accessible dwelling units as required
by this chapter or Colorado law, said building project (orphase) shall be constructed such that
all such required accessible dwelling units in such building project (or phase) provide the same
functional features as are provided in the nonaccessible units in such building project (or
phase). Furthermore, such functional features except for dwelling unit bedroom-types shall be
provided in the same proportion as in the nonaccessible units. Not less than 50 percent of the
required accessible dwelling units shall be constructed with the distribution of accessible
dwelling unit bedroom-types being proportionally the same as the distribution of nonaccessible
dwelling unit bedroom-types, provided that at least one of each dwelling unit bedroom-type
constructed in the building project (or phase) shall be an accessible dwelling unit.

For purposes of this Section, the following definitions shall apply. 'Dwelling unit bedroom-
type' shall mean the number of bedrooms within the dwelling unit. 'Functional feature' shall
mean: a closet, a garage, a carport, a patio, a deck, additional rooms (such as a bedroom,
bathroom, den, storeroom, laundry or similar room) and any other significant feature built at
the time of original construction that offers occupants improved convenience or comfort.
Aesthetic or decorative features such as colors, architectural design elements, trim and finish
materials, decorative heating appliances not providing the primary comfort heat source,
lighting fixture style, cabinet and hardware style, plumbing fixture style, the type and location
of windows and glazed lights, or any similar miscellaneous features shall not be construed as
functional features.”

(38) Section 1203.3 Under-floor ventilation is amended by adding two new paragraphs to read as
follows:

“The ground surface of the under floor space shall be covered with a vapor retarder material.
The vapor retarder shall be a minimum 10-mil non-reinforced polyethylene sheet when tested
in accordance with ASTM E154-99. The sheet shall be continuously sealed in an approved
manner to the foundation walls, to the interior caissons or footing pads, plumbing lines and at
all laps of multiple sheets. :

Mechanical ventilation systems for spaces under below grade floors shall designed by a

professional engineer; addressing moisture controls and by approved methods considering the
impact of negative pressures created by exhaust fans, clothes dryers and similar apphances ”

14



(39) Section 1211 Radon-resistant construction is amended by adding a new section to read as
follows:

“SECTION 1211 - RADON-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION

1211.1 Scope. The provisions of this code shall apply to new R-2 Occupancies, multi-family
dwellings.

1211.1 Purpose. The purpose of this code is to provide minimum requirements to enhance
the public safety, health and general welfare, through construction methods designed and

_ installed to resist entry of radon gas into the occupied spaces of buildings regulated by this
code.

SECTION 1211.2 - DEFINITIONS

1211.2.1 General. For the purpose of these requirements, the terms used shall be
defined as follows:

FOUNDATION DRAIN SYSTEM. A continuous length of drain tile, perforated pipe,
or filter mat extending around all or part of the internal or external perimeter of a
basement or crawl space footing designed to collect and drain away excess subsurface
water. |

RADON. A naturally occurring, chemically inert, radioactive gas that is not detectable
by human senses and can move readily through particles of soil and rock and can
accumulate under the slabs and foundations of homes where it can easily enter the
living space through construction cracks and openings.

SOIL-GAS-RETARDER. A continucus membrane of 3-mil (O.-O75 mm) cross-linked
polyethylene or other equivalent material used to retard the flow of soil gases into a
building. ‘ '

SUBFLOOR. A concrete slab and other approved permanent floor system that directly
contacts the ground and is within the walls of the living spaces of the building.

SUB-MEMBRANE DEPRESSURIZATION SYSTEM. A system designed to
achieve lower sub-membrane air pressure relative to crawl space air pressure by use of
a vent drawing air from beneath the soil-gas-retarder membrane.

SUB-SLLAB DEPRESSURIZATION SYSTEM (Passive). A system designed to
achieve lower sub-slab air pressure relative to indoor air pressure by use of a vent pipe
routed through the conditioned space of a building and connecting the sub-slab area
with outdoor air, thereby relying on the convective flow of air upward in the vent to
draw air from beneath the slab.

SECTION 1211.3 - REQUIREMENTS

1211.3.1 General. The following required construction methods are intended to resist
radon entry and prepare the building for post-construction radon mitigation.

15



1211.3.2 Subfloor preparation. A layer of gas-permeable material shall be placed
under all subfloors. The gas-permeable layer shall consist of one of the following
methods except that where fills of aggregate size less than that described in Method 1
are used beneath a slab, Method 2,3, 4, or 5 must be used.

1. A uniform layer of clean aggregate, a minimum of 4 inches (102 mm) thick. The
aggregate shall consist of material that will pass through a 2-inch (51 mm) sieve
and be retained by a % -inch (6.4 mm) sieve. In buildings where interior footings or
other barriers separate sub-grade areas, penetrations through the interior footing or
barrier equal to a minimum of 12 square inches (0.094 m?) per 10 feet (3.048 m) of
barrier length shall be provided. A minimum of two penetrations shall be provided
per separation and be evenly spaced along the separation.

EXCEPTION:

In buildings where igterior/ footings or other barriers separate the sub-grade
area, separate radon vent pipes may be installed for each sub-grade area as
specified in Section 1211.5.2 in place of penetrations through the barrier.

2. A foundation drain pipe system installed under concrete floor slab areas less than
2,000 square feet (186 m?), consisting of a continuous loop of minimum 3-inch (76
mm) diameter perforated pipe shall be laid in the sub-grade with the top of pipe
located 1 inch (25.4 mm) below the concrete slab. The pipe may be rigid or flexible
but shall have perforations fully around the circumference with a free air space
equal to 1.83 square inches per square foot (127 cm*m?) of exterior pipe surface
area. Such pipe shall be wrapped with approved filter material to prevent blocking
of pipe perforations. The pipe loop shall be located inside of the exterior perimeter
foundation walls not more than 12 inches (305 mm) from the perimeter foundation
walls, In buildings where interior footings or other barriers separate the sub-grade
area, the loop of pipe shall penetrate, or pass beneath such interior footings or
barriers. For slab areas greater than 2,000 square feet (186 m”) but less than 4,000
square feet (372 m %), the preceding conﬁgurat10n may be used, provided a
minimum of 4- mch diameter (102 mm) pipe is installed. Slabs in excess of 4,000
square feet (372 m?) shall have under them separate loops for every additional
2,000 square feet (186 m?) of slab area when 3-inch (76 mm) diameter pipe is used;
or, slabs may have separate loops provided for each additional increment in area
between 2,000 square feet (186 m?) and 4,000 square feet (372 m®) when 4-inch
(102 mm) diameter pipe is used.

3. A foundation drain soil gas collection mat system installed under concrete floor
slab areas of 2,000 square feet (186 m’) or less, consisting of a continuous
rectilinear loop of soil gas collection mat or drainage mat having minimum
dimensions of 1 inch in height by 12 inches in width (25.4 mm in height x 305 mm
in w1dth) and a nominal cross-sectional air flow area of 12 square inches (0.0078
m?) may be laid on top of the sub-grade. The mat shall be constructed of a matrix

16



that allows for the movement of air through it and be capable of supporting the
concrete placed upon it. The matrix shall be covered by approved filter material on
all four sides to prevent dirt or concrete from entering the matrix. All breaches and
joints in the filter material shall be repaired prior to the placement of the slab. The
loop shall be located inside the exterior perimeter foundation walls and within 12
inches (305 mm) from the perimeter foundation walls. In buildings where interior
footings or other barriers separate the sub-grade area, the mat shall penetrate these
interior footings or barriers to form a contlnuous loop around the exterior
perimeter.

Slabs larger than 2,000 square feet (186 m?) but less than 4,000 square feet (372
m?) shall have under them an additional strip of mat that bisects the loop forming
two areas approximately equally divided by the two halves of the rectilinear loop.
Slabs larger than 4,000 square feet (372 m?) shall have separate loops for each
2,000 (186 m?) square feet; or, increased to 4,000 square feet (372 m2) when a loop
is bisected as specified in the preceding configuration.

4. A uniform layer of sand (native or fill), a minimum of 4 inches (102 mm) thick,
overlain by a layer or strips of geo-textile drainage matting designed to allow the
lateral flow of soil gases.

5. Other materials, systems or floor designs with demonstrated capability to permit
depressurization across the entire sub-floor area.

1211.3.3 Entry routes. Potential radon entry routes shall be closed in accordance with
Sections 1211.3.4.1 through 1211.3.4.8

1211.3.3.1 Floor openings. Openings around bathtubs, showers, water closets,
pipes, wires or other objects that penetrate concrete slabs or other floor assemblies
shall be filled with a polyurethane caulk or equivalent sealant applied in accordance
with the manufacturer's recommendations.

1211.3.3.2 Concrete joints. All control joints, isolation joints, construction joints
and any other joints in concrete slabs or between slabs and foundation walls shall
be sealed with a caulk or sealant. Gaps and joints shall be cleared of loose material
and filled with polyurethane caulk or other elastomeric sealant applied in
accordance with the manufacturer's recommendations.

1211.3.3.3 Condensate drains. Condensate drains shall be trapped or routed
through non-perforated pipe to daylight.

17



1211.3.3.4 Sumps. Sump pits open to soil or serving as the termination point for
sub-slab or exterior drain tile loops shall be covered with a gasketed or otherwise
sealed lid. Sumps used as the suction point in a sub-slab depressurization system
shall have a lid designed to accommodate the vent pipe. Sumps used as a floor
drain shall have a lid equipped with a trapped inlet and view port.

1211.3.3.5 Foundation walls. Hollow block masonry foundation walls shall be
constructed with either a continuous course of solid masonry, one course of
masonry grouted solid, or a solid concrete beam at or above finished ground surface
to prevent passage of air from the interior of the wall into the living space. Where a
brick veneer or other masonry ledge is installed, the course immediately below that
ledge shall be sealed. Joints, cracks or other openings around all penetrations of
both exterior and interior surfaces of masonry block or wood foundation walls
below the ground surface shall be filled with polyurethane caulk or equivalent
sealant. Penetrations of concrete walls shall be filled.

1211.3.3.6 Dampproofing. The exterior surfaces of portions of concrete and
masonry block walls below the ground surface shall be damp-proofed in
accordance with Section 1805.

1211.3.3.7 Air-handling units. Air-handling units in crawl spaces shall be sealed
to prevent air from being drawn into the unit.

EXCEPTION:

Units with gasketed seams or units that are otherwise sealed by the
manufacturer to prevent leakage.

1211.3.3.8 Ducts. Ductwork passing through or beneath a slab shall be of seamless
material unless the air-handling system is designed to maintain continuous positive-
pressure within such ducting. Joints in such ductwork shall be sealed to prevent air
leakage. Ductwork located in crawl spaces shall have all seams and joints sealed by
closure systems in accordance with the International Mechanical Code.

1211.3.4 Sub-membrane depressurization system. In buildings with interior
structural floors directly above under-floor spaces containing exposed soil surfaces that
are not protected by a sub-slab depressurization system, the following components of
sub-membrane depressurization system shall be installed during construction.

EXCEPTION:

18



Buildings in which an approved mechanical ventilation system complying with
Section 1203 or such other equivalent system that provides equivalent
depressurization across the entire sub-membrane area as determined by the building
official is installed in the under-floor spaces.

1211.3.4.1 Ventilation. Crawl spaces and similar under-floor spaces shall be
provided with ventilation complying with Section 1203.

1211.3.4.2 Soil-gas-retarder. The exposed soil in under-floor spaces shall be
covered with a continuous layer of soil-gas-retarder. Such groundcover joints shall
overlap 6 inches (152 mm) and be sealed or taped. The edges of the groundcover
shall extend a minimum of 6 inches (152 mm) up onto all foundation walls
enclosing the under-floor space and shall be attached and sealed to foundation
walls in an approved manner.

1211.3.4.3 Vent pipe riser. A plumbing tee or other approved connection shall be

inserted horizontally beneath the sheeting and connected to a 3- or 4-inch-diameter
(76 mm or 102 mm) fitting with a vertical vent pipe installed through the sheeting.
The vent pipe shall be extended up through the building floors, terminate at least 12
inches (305 mm) above the roof in a location at least 10 feet (3.048 m) away from
any window or other opening into the conditioned spaces of the building that is less
than 2 feet (0.610 m) below the exhaust point, and 10 feet (3.048 m) from any
window or other opening in adjoining or adjacent buildings.

1211.3.5 Sub-slab depressurization system. The following components of a sub-slab
depressurization system shall be installed during construction under basement or slab-
on-grade floors. ‘

1211.5.1 Vent pipe riser. A minimum 3-inch-diameter (76 mm) ABS, PVC or
equivalent gas-tight pipe shall be embedded vertically into the sub-slab aggregate
or other permeable material before the slab is cast. A 'T' fitting or equivalent
method shall be used to ensure that the pipe opening remains within the sub-slab
permeable material. Alternatively, the 3-inch (76 mm) pipe shall be inserted
directly into an interior perimeter drain tile loop or through a sealed sump cover
where the sump is exposed to the sub-slab aggregate or connected to it through a
drainage system.

All vent pipes shall be extended up through the building floors, terminate at least
12 inches (305 mm) above the surface of the roof in a location at least 10 feet
(3.048 m) away from any window, air intake, or other opening into the conditioned

19



spaces of the building that is less than 2 feet (0.610 m) below the exhaust point,
and 10 feet (3.048 m) from any window or other opening in adjoining or adjacent
buildings. The discharge end of vent pipe terminations shall be unobstructed and
protected from small animal entry with a corrosion-resistant screen having
openings between % inch (6.4 mm) and % inch (12.7 mm).

1211.3.5.2 Multiple vent pipes. In buildings where interior footings or other
barriers separate the sub-slab aggregate or other gas-permeable material, each area
shall be fitted with an individual vent pipe. Vent pipes shall connect to a single
vent that terminates above the roof or each individual vent pipe shall terminate
separately above the roof.

1211.3.6 Vent pipe drainage. All components of the radon vent pipe system shall be
installed to provide positive drainage to the ground beneath the slab or soil-gas
retarder.

1211.3.7 Vent pipe accessibility. Radon vent pipes shall be accessible for fan
installation through an attic or other area outside the habitable space.

EXCEPTION:

The radon vent pipe need not be accessible in an attic space where an approved
roof-top electrical supply is provided. '

1211.3.8 Vent pipe identification and notification. All exposed and visible interior
radon vent pipes shall be conspicuously identified with at least one label on each floor
and in attics provided with access openings. The label shall read substantially as
follows: 'Radon Reduction System.' In addition to the preceding label, a notice shall be
placed in a conspicuous area near the vent pipe that includes the following statement:

‘THIS RADON REDUCTION SYSTEM IS NOT REQUIRED TO BE TESTED AND
IS A'PASSIVE'SYSTEM, RELYING ENTIRELY ON NATURAL VENTILATION.
OCCUPANTS ARE ADVISED TO TEST FOR RADON AND TAKE REMEDIAL
ACTION AS NECESSARY BY INSTALLING A CONTINUOUSLY OPERATING
FAN LOCATED IN THE VENT PIPE (ACCESS TYPICALLY PROVIDED IN THE
ATTIC) AND CONNECTED TO THE NEARBY PROVIDED ELECTRICAL
OUTLET. CALL 1-800-767-RADON FOR MORE INFORMATION.’

1211.3.9 Combination foundations. Combination basement/crawl space or slab-on-
grade/crawl space foundations shall have separate radon vent pipes installed in each

20,



type of foundation area. Each radon vent pipe shall terminate above the roof or shall be
connected to a single vent that terminates above the roof.

1211.3.10 Building depressurization. Joints in air ducts and plenums in
unconditioned spaces shall be substantially air tight and permanently sealed with an
approved sealant, mastic, or other approved methods. Thermal envelope air infiltration
requirements shall comply with the energy conservation provisions in the energy
conservation code currently enacted by the City. Firestopping shall be in conformance
with the most recent general building code enacted by the City.

1211.3.11 Provisions for future depressurization fan installation. Permanent
provisions shall be made for the future installation of an in-line fan to be connected to
every radon vent pipe. Such designated fan locations shall be outside of the conditioned
envelope of the building, such as in the attic, garage and similar locations, excluding
crawl spaces and other interior under-floor spaces. Designated locations shall
accommodate an unobstructed permanent cylindrical space with the following
minimum dimensions: 12 inches (305 mm) measured radially around the radon vent
pipe along a vertical distance of 30 inches (760 mm). Designated fan locations shall be
permanently accessible for servicing and maintenance. An electrical circuit shall be
provided within 4 feet (1.219 m) of and within sight from designated fan locations.
Such circuit shall have a means of positive disconnection and be terminated in an
approved electrical outlet in accordance with the applicable current electric code.

7

1211.3.11.1 Depressurization fan system activation. When a passive system as
constructed in accordance with this code is to be converted to an active system, an
approved in-line fan shall be installed in a designated fan location as specified in
Section 1211.11.1. Additionally, an approved permanent electric light fixture and
in-line pipe couplings that facilitate fan replacement shall be provided. The in-line
fan shall be designed to operate continuously for a period of not less than 5 years
and have a minimum air-flow rating as established by the building official. A
readily accessible manometer or other approved waming device that notifies
occupants of a fan malfunction by a visible or audible signal shall be installed
within the dwelling unit.”

(40) Section 1505.1General is amended in its entirety to read as follows.

“1505.1 New Construction. The roof-covering classification on any new structure
regulated by this code shall be Class A. '

EXCEPTIONS:

21



1. Noncombustible roof coverings as defined in Section 1507.3, 1507.4, 1507.5 may
be applied in accordance with the manufacturer's specifications in place of a fire-
retardant roofing assembly.

2. Any Class B or Class C roof covering may be applied on any new construction that
is added to an existing building classified as a Group R, Division 3 Occupancy,
provided the roof extremities of such existing building and new construction are
located a minimum distance of 5 feet to the nearest adjacent property line and are a
minimum distance of 10 feet to another building.”

(41) Table 1505.1, Minimum Roof Covering Classifications For Types of Construction, is
hereby deleted.

(41) Section 1507.2.9.4 Sidewall flashing 1s amended by adding a new section read as follows:

“1507.2.9.4 Sidewall flashing. Flashing against a vertical sidewall shall be by the step-
flashing method. The flashing shall be a minimum of 4 inches (102 mm)} high and 4 inches
(102 mm) wide. At the end of the vertical sidewall the step flashing shall be turned out in a
manner that directs water away from the wall and onto the roof and/or gutter.

EXCEPTION:

For re-roofing where step flashing would require removal of siding material, provided
adequate flashing is installed.”

(43) Section 1507.2.9.5 Other flashing is amended by adding a new section read as follows:

“1507.2.9.5 Other flashing. Flashing against a vertical front wall, as well as soil stack, vent
pipe and chimney flashing shall be applied according to the asphalt shingle manufacturer’s
printed instructions.”

(44) REROOFING, Section 1510.1 is amended by adding two paragraphs at the end to read as
follows:

“No portion of an existing nonrated roof covering may be permanently replaced or covered
with more than one square of nonrated roof covering.

Any existing roof covering system may be replaced with a roof covering of the same
materials and classification, provided the replacement roof covering has a minimum
rating of Class C.”

(45) Section 1608.2 Ground snow load, the first sentence is amended to read as follows:

22



“1608.2 Ground Snow Loads. The ground snow loads to be used in determining the design
snow loads for roofs shall be shall be 30 psf. as determined in accordance with ASCE 7 or
Figure 1608.2 for the contiguous United States and Table 1608.2 for Alaska.”

(46) Section 1609.3 Basic wind speed, the first sentence is amended to read as follows:

“1609.3 Basic wind speed. The basic wind speed, in mph, for the determination of the wind
loads shall be one hundred (100) miles per hour (161 kph) as determined by Figure 1609.”

(47) Section 1804.3.1Final Grading is amended by adding a new section to read as follows:

“1804.3.1 Final Grading. Final grading adjacent to the foundation shall be compacted
sufficiently and in such a manner that it is not undermined or subject to significant settlement
or displacement due to improper placement of backfill.”

(48) Section 2406.4 Hazardous locations Item 5 is amended to read as follows:

“5. Glazing in doors and enclosures for hot tubs, whirlpools, saunas, steam rooms, bathtubs
and showers. Glazing in any portion of a building wall enclosing these compartments
where the bottom exposed edge of the glazing is less than 60 inches (1524 mm) above a
standing surface and where any portion of such glazing is within 48 inches of an interior
surface of hot tubs, whirlpools, saunas, steam rooms, bathtubs and showers.”

(49) Section 2902.1 Touch-free toilet facilities is amended by adding a new section read as follows:

“2902.1.3 Touch-free toilet facilities. Toilet facilities installed for occupancies associated

with food preparation or food service to the public shall be provided with:

1. Automatic touch-free water control valves on lavatories.

2. Automatic touch-free paper towel dispensers.

3. Toilet facilities exit doors that allow exiting without requiring touching by hand, any door
hardware, such as knobs, levers, sliding bolts, latches and similar devices.

EXCEPTION:

Toilet facilities designed as a single occupant use may be provided with exit door locking
hardware to afford privacy.”

(50) Section 3109.6 Barriers around decorative pools, fountains, and ponds is hereby added to
read as follows:

23



1y

- ~City Clerk

“3109.6 Barriers around decorative i)ools, fountains, and ponds. Decorative pools,
fountains, and ponds which can contain water deeper than 24 inches (610 mm), shall be protected by
barriers installed in accordance with section 3109.4.”

(51) Appendix C GROUP UAGRICULTURAL BUILDINGS is adopted in its entirety.
(52) Appendix E SUPPLEMENTARY ACCESSIBILITY REQUIREMENTS, is adopted in its

entirety.
(53) Appendix I PATIO COVERS is adopted in its entirety.

Introduced, considered favorably on first reading, and ordered published this 7th day of

* September, A.D. 2010, and to be presented for final passage on the 21st day of September, A.D.

2010.

e k.

Ma or

ATTEST:

City Clerk

Passed and adopted on final reading on the 21st day of September, A.D. 2010.

" ATTEST: -

24



	2009 IBC Amendments cover sheet.pdf
	09-ibc-amend
	Page 1
	Page 2
	Page 3
	Page 4
	Page 5
	Page 6
	Page 7
	Page 8
	Page 9
	Page 10
	Page 11
	Page 12
	Page 13
	Page 14
	Page 15
	Page 16
	Page 17
	Page 18
	Page 19
	Page 20
	Page 21
	Page 22
	Page 23
	Page 24


