ORDINANCE NO. 049, 2008
OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FORT COLLINS
AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE II, DIVISION 2, OF THECITY CODE
FOR THE PURPOSE OF ADOPTING THID06 INTERNATIONAL
BUILDING (IBC)®, WITH AMENDMENTS

WHEREAS, the current general building code adopte@ity is based on the last and final
version of the defundNIFORM BUILDING CODE, 1997 EDITIONoublished by the former
International Conference of Building Officials (ICB, as enacted in May 1998; and

WHEREAS, since 2000, ICBO dissolved following itemger with the other two former
nationally prominent building-code promulgatingamngations, to emerge as théernational Code
Council (ICC)® and

WHEREAS thousands &€C member jurisdictions from across the country andd the
world, following extensive and ongoing deliberaspoonvened to cast final ballots for the approval
of the latest published triennial suite of tk& model building codes, t1#006 INTERNATIONAL
CODES ®for the express purpose of inclusively regulathrgconstruction, alteration, movement,
enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use@upancy, location, removal and demolition
of every type of building; and

WHEREAS, a volunteer code-review task group (regmeed by code officials from the City
of Fort Collins, Poudre Fire Authority, and Larim@ounty, the professional building and design
industries in the Larimer County region, and vasiother contributors as needed) has completed an
extensive review of th2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®&he companiohCC mid-
triennial update in the form of tf#007 IBC SUPPLEMENT @&n addition to the proposed local
amendments thereto; and

WHEREAS, the Affordable Housing Board, the Air QtiaAdvisory Board, the Building
Review Board, the Electric Board, the Health Dcttof Northern Larimer County Board, the
Natural Resources Advisory Board, the Planning Zading Board, and the Commission on
Disability have made certain recommendations wispect to the adoption of th2006
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®&nd proposed amendments; and

WHEREAS, the Council of the City of Fort Collinsshdetermined that it is in the best
interest of the health, safety and welfare of tig &hd its citizens that tH2006 INTERNATIONAL
BUILDING CODE® as amended be adopted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THCITY OF FORT
COLLINS that Chapter 5, Article I, Division 2 ofi¢ Code of the City of Fort Collins is hereby
amended and revised in the following respects:



Section 1. That Section 5-26 subparagraph (a)eo€tde of the City of Fort Collins is
hereby repealed and reenacted to read as follows:

(@) There is hereby adopted by reference, as ulidimg code of the City, th@006
International Building Code (IBE) published by thinternational Code Council (ICE) as

if set forth in full herein. The subject matter tife codes adopted herein includes
comprehensive provisions and standards reguldtegriection, construction, enlargement,
alteration, repair, moving, removal, conversionndétion, occupancy, equipment, use,
height, area and maintenance of buildings and tstres, exclusive of detached one- and
two-family dwellings and multiple single-family diliags (townhouses) not more than three
(3) stories above grade and their associated angestaictures, for the purpose of protecting
the public health, safety and general welfare.

Section 2. That Section 5-27 Code of the City aft &pbllins is hereby repealed and
reenacted to read as follows:

Sec. 5-27. Amendments and deletions to code.

The2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE&opted herein is hereby amended
in the following respects:

(1) Section 10lis hereby amended in the following respects:
(a) Section 101.1s amended to read as follows:

“101.1. Title.These regulations shall be known as@ameral Building Code of the City of
Fort Collins, hereinafter referred to as ‘this Code’.”

(b) Section 101.4s amended by adding the following new subsectbtise end thereof reading
as follows:

“101.4.8 All references to thénternational Residential Codshall mean the general
residential building code currently in effect asieted by the City.

101.4.9All references to thénternational Plumbing Codshall mean the plumbing code
currently in effect in the City.

101.4.10All references to thinternational Fire Codeshall mean the fire code currently in
effect as enacted by the City.



101.4.11All references to thénternational Mechanical Codshall mean the mechanical
code currently in effect as enacted by the City.

101.4.12All references to thénternational Fuel-gas Codshall mean the fuel-gas code
currently in effect as enacted by the City.

101.4.13Areas prone to flooding.All references to ‘flood hazard’ and ‘areas praoe
flooding’ in this code and appendices adopted thigheshall be as specified in tid®ode of
the City “Chapter 10, Flood Prevention and Protectibn

(2) Section 103s amended to read as follows:
“SECTION 103 — CODE ADMINISTRATION

103.1 Entity charged with code administration. The executive building-code official,
appointed by the City Manager, is charged wittdihect overall administration and enforcement
of this code; and, in the performance of said dutieay delegate the necessary authority to the
appropriate technical, administrative, and comglkastaff under the supervision the executive
building-code official.”

(3) Section 105.2 under the heading dBuilding, is amended to read as follows:

“Building:
1. Detached accessory buildings used for playhols&s and garden equipment storage,
tool storage and similar uses provided such bugloio not exceed one hundred twenty
(120) square feet of floor area nor eight (8) fiedteight, do not house flammable liquids
in quantities exceeding ten (10) gallons per boddand are constructed entirely of
noncombustible materials when located less thaeetl{B) feet from an adjoining
property line

2. Fences not over 6 feet (1829 mm) high.

3. Oil derricks.

4. Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1218)rim height measured from the bottom of
the footing to the top of the wall, unless suppgt surcharge or impounding Class I, Il

or IlIA liquids.

5. Water tanks supported directly on grade if dqgacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons (18
925 L) and the ratio of height to diameter or widtes not exceed 2:1.



6. Platforms and decks intended for human occupanerlking, sidewalks and driveways
not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above adjacedegemd not over any basement or
story below and are not part of an accessible route

7. Painting, wallpapering, tiling, carpeting, texbtg, cabinetry and similar finish or cosmetic
work.

8. Temporary motion picture, television and theatage sets and scenery.

9. Prefabricated portable swimming or wading pdatd,tubs or spas accessory to a Group
R-3 occupancy that are less than 24 inches (610dwesy), do not exceed 5,000 gallons
(18 925 L) and are installed entirely above ground.

10. Shade cloth structures constructed for nurseggricultural purposes, not including
service systems.

11. Swings and other playground equipment accegsodgtached one- and two-family
dwellings.

12. Window awningsupported by an exterior wall on Group R, Divis®and Group U
Occupancies projecting not more than 54 inches Z118m), window replacement
requiring no structural alteration and when suchkvi®determined not to be historically
significant, storm window, storm door and rain guihstallation.

13. Nonfixed and movable fixtures, cases, rackentas and partitions not over 5 feet 9
inches (1753 mm) in height.

14 Exterior walks, driveways, parking lots excaptrequired for facility accessibility by
Chapter 11.

15. Roofing repair or replacement work not excegaine square of covering per building.

16. Minor work valued at less than five hundredats!($500.) and not involving alteration
of bearing walls, structural or fire-rated asseedlplumbing, electrical or mechanical
components or fire-extinguishing systems.”

(4) Section 105.% amended to read as follows:

“105.5 Permit expiration and incompletion of authoized work. Every permit issued, both
prior to and subsequent to the effective date sf tbde, shall become invalid if the work
authorized by such permit has not been commendbdhwvane hundred eighty (180) days after
issuance of the permit, or if such work, once comeed, is suspended or abandoned for a period
of one hundred eighty (180) days after the datevibrk was commenced. The building official

is authorized to grant, in writing, extensionsiofe for periods of not more than one hundred
eighty (180) days each. Each extension must beestgd in writing and justifiable cause
demonstrated. No more than two such extensionsdomgyanted by the building official unless
the additional extension(s) have first been apptdmethe Building Review Board.

4



Both prior to and subsequent to the effective dathis code, any work authorized by a permit
regulated by this code, or under any other buildingstruction code administered by the
building official, that involves the constructionalteration of an exterior building component,

assembly or finish material, such as the foundataall and roof framing, sheathing, siding,

fenestration, and roof covering, shall be fully gdeted for permanent outdoor exposure within
twenty-four (24) months of the date of issuanceuwth permit, regardless of when the permit
was issued. Failure to comply with the foregoimgetiperiod shall constitute a violation of this

code, resulting in revocation of the permit, andlisbubject the permit holder and property
owner to all penalties provided by the Code of ¢itg. No such revoked permit may be

reinstated, nor shall a new permit be issued farkvpweviously authorized by the revoked

permit, unless such reinstatement or issuancenefxapermit has first been approved by the
Building Review Board.”

(5) Section 106.3 amended by adding a new subsection theretollasvé:

“106.3.5 Time limitation of application.Applications for which a permit has not been issue

within one-hundred eighty (180) days following tiae of application shall automatically expire
and plans submitted for code-compliance review thageafter be returned to the applicant or
destroyed by the building official. The buildingiofal may extend the time for action by the

applicant for a period not exceeding ninety (90ysdapon written request by the applicant
showing that circumstances beyond the controleéfiplicant have prevented action from being
taken. In order to renew action on an applicatitber &xpiration, the applicant shall resubmit

plans and plan review fee as provided in this code.

(6) Section 108, Feess amended in the following respects:
(a) Section 108.1s amended to read as follows:

“108.1 Payment of feesNo permit with any amendments and related constru@lans
therefor shall be valid until the fees prescribgdh® city manager pursuant to Chapter 7.5,
Articles | through VI of the Code of the city, aidd, 'ADMINISTRATIVE FEES,' have
been paid.”

(b) Section 108.6 amended to read as follows:

“108.6 Fee refunds Any fee paid hereunder that is erroneously paidotiected shall be
refunded. The building official may authorize tleéunding of ninety percent (90) percent of
a plan review fee or building permit fee to the laggmt who paid such fee pursuant to this
Section, provided the plan review is withdrawnameelled and the plan review and/or work
authorized under a permit issued in accordance thithcode has not commenced, and
provided further such plan review or permit is gtaind not expired as set forth in this
Section. Prior to authorizing the refunding of deg paid to the original applicant or
permittee, a written request from such party mesisbbmitted to the City within one
hundred eighty (180) days of the date of the feeneat.”



(7) Section 112, Appeals amended to read as follows:

“112.1 General.The Building Review Board (hereafter 'Board’) steblished in Section 2-117
of the Code of the city of Fort Collins is herelymowered in accordance with the procedures
set forth in this Section to hear and to decidesafgpof orders, decisions, or determinations
made by the building official relative to the agpliion and interpretation of this code and to the
suitability of alternate materials or alternate Inoets of construction. The building official shall
be an ex officio member of the Board without vatd ahall serve as the Secretary of the Board.
The Board shall adopt rules of procedure for cotidgcits business, and shall render all
decisions and findings in writing.

112.2 Applications/hearingsWhen a building permit applicant or a holder btidding permit
desires relief from any decision of the buildin§j®@&l related to the enforcement of this code,
except as is otherwise limited in Section 105.4hdwwilding permit applicant, building permit
holder, or representative thereof may appeal teesida of the building official to the Board
stating that such decision by the building offisi@s based on an erroneous interpretation of the
building regulations or that an alternate desi¢feraate materials and/or the alternate methods
of construction proposed by the appellant are edeint to those prescribed by this code
considering structural strength, effectivenesg, fesistance, durability, safety and any other
pertinent factors.

The Board shall hear and decide all appeals madeata shall have the authority to rule in
favor of the appellant when the Board determines the interpretation of the building
regulations of the city by the building official #arroneous, or when the Board determines an
alternate design, alternate materials and/or tieenate methods proposed by the appellant are
equivalent to those prescribed by this code consigestructural strength, effectiveness, fire
resistance, durability, safety and any other peniirfactors. The Board shall require that
sufficient evidence be submitted to substantiatg @daims made regarding the proposed
alternate design, alternate materials and/or @termethods of construction. A quorum of four
(4) members shall be necessary for any meetinigeoBbard."

112.3 Fees and notificationPersons desiring to appeal to the Board any deaidithe building
official as provided in this Section 112 shallttee time of filing such appeal, pay to the city a
filing fee in the amount of fifty dollars ($50.). Niten notice of hearings shall be given to the
Appellant and, with respect to requests for excagtior variances authorized pursuant to
Section 1101.1 of this code, to the secretaryeéddbmmission on Disability, at least three (3)
days prior to the hearing by mailing the same thsqarty's last known address by regular U.S.
mail.

112.4 Limitations. The Building Review Board shall have no authauiith respect to any of the
following functions:

1. The administration of this code;



2. Waiving requirements of this code, except asidea for pursuant to this Section 105;

3. Modifying the applicable provisions of, or griaugtvariances to, this code, or approving
the use of alternate designs, alternate matenal®aalternate methods of construction
except as provided for in this Section 112 and ¢hag®n a specific appeal from a
determination or decision of the building offic@l an individual case basis; and

4. Modifying, interpreting, or ruling on the apgiaility or intent of the zoning and land use
regulations or other laws of the city except asesgly empowered otherwise.”

(8) Section 113— VIOLATION® amended in the following respects:
(a) Section 113.4is amended to read as follows:

“113.4 PenaltiesPersons who violate a provision of this code dtdecomply with any of
the requirements thereof or who erect, install withr on, alter or repair a building or
structure in violation of the approved constructabmcuments or directive of the code
official, or of a permit or certificate issued undee provisions of this code, shall be guilty
of a misdemeanor subject to the penalties and poesuant to Section 1-15 of the Code of
the city.

(b) New,Subsection 113.% added at the end thereof to read as follows:

“113.5 Work commencing before permit issuanceln addition to penalties set forth in
Subsection R113.4, any person or firm who, befdy&@ining the necessary permit(s),
commences any construction of, or work on, a bogdstructure, electrical, gas, mechanical
or plumbing system that is not otherwise exempteih fobtaining a permit, shall be subject
to a processing and penalty fee in addition todtamdard prescribed permit fee. Such
additional fee shall be equal to the permit feegpxthat such fee shall not be less than fifty
dollars ($50) nor more than one thousand dollatsO() for the first such violation. A
person or firm committing the same such violatiepeatedly is subject to processing and
penalty fees equal to double the amount of the pdea or double the amount of the
preceding violation, whichever is greater, for gveame such subsequent violation
committed thereafter within any 180-day period. Tdregoing fees may be appealed to the
city manager pursuant to Chapter 2, Article Vileg Code of the City.”

(9) Section 202, Definitionss amended in the following respects:
(a) The definition of "BUILDING OFFICIAL" is amendkto read as follows:

“BUILDING-CODE OFFICIAL. The executive building-code official designatedHoy
City Manager charged with the overall administnatend enforcement of this code as
described in Section 103.1.”

(b) The definition of "FAMILY" is added to read &sdlows:
“FAMILY is defined as set forth in the Land Use Code efcity.”
(c) The definition of “ROOM, SLEEPING” is addedread as follows:

7



“ROOM, SLEEPING (BEDROOM). A habitable room within a dwelling or other hougin
unit designed primarily for the purpose of sleepifige presence of a bed, cot, mattress,
convertible sofa or other similar furnishing usex &leeping purposes is indicia for
determining that such space or room qualifies sle@ping room. The presence of closets
and similar storage facilities are not consideereéevant factors in determining whether or
not a room is a sleeping room.”

(d) The definition of “STORY ABOVE GRADE PLANE” iadded to read as follows:

“STORY ABOVE GRADE PLANE. Any story having its finished floor surface entyrel
above grade plane, or in which the finished surtddee floor above is:

1. More than 6 feet (1829 mm) above grade plane; or

2. More than 12 feet (3658 mm) above the finishedigd level at any point.”

(e) The definition of “TOWNHOUSE” is amended t@deas follows:

TOWNHOUSE. A single-family dwelling unit constructed as paftaogroup of two or
more attached individual dwelling units, each ofahhs separated from the other from the
foundation to the roof and is located entirely aseparately recorded and platted parcel of

land (site) bounded by property lines, and whialeglas deeded exclusively for such single-
family dwelling.

(10) Section 303.1s amended by the addition of exceptions numédensd5 to read as follows:

“4. Assembly areas that are accessory to GroupcEpancies are not considered separate
occupancies except when applying the assembly acoypequirements of Chapter 11.

5. Accessory religious educational rooms and mligiauditoriums with occupant loads of
less than 100 are not considered separate occegdnci

(12) Section 419s amended to read as follows:
“Section 419 — RESIDENCE/WORK UNITS

419.1 GeneralA residence/work unit is a dwelling unit or slegpimit in which a significant
portion of the space includes a nonresidentialtbaeis operated by the tenant and shall
comply with Section 419.
Exception: Dwelling or sleeping units that include an offibat is less than 10 percent
of the area of the dwelling unit shall not be difeesd as a residence/work unit.

419.1.1 Limitations.The following shall apply to all residence/work ase
1. The residence/work unit is permitted to be aimar of 3,000 square feet (279
2
m);
2. The nonresidential area is permitted to be aimnamx 50 percent of the area of
each residence/work unit;



3. The nonresidential area function shall be lichit@the first or main floor only of
the residence/work unit; and

4. A maximum of five nonresidential workers or enyges are allowed to occupy
the non-residential area at any one time.

419.1.2 OccupanciesResidence/work units shall be classified as a GrBup
occupancy. Separation requirements found in Se&@@#3 shall not apply when the
residence/work unit is in compliance with Sectioh94 High-hazard and storage
occupancies shall not be permitted in a residera&/anit. The aggregate of storage in
the residence/work unit shall be limited to 10 petcof the space dedicated to
nonresidential activities.

419.1.3 Means of egresExcept as modified by this section, the provision&roup R-
2 occupancies in Chapter 10 shall apply to theenéisidence/work unit.

419.1.3.1 Egress capacity The egress capacity for each element of the
residence/work unit shall be based on the occudaadyfor the occupancy served in
accordance with Table 1004.1.1.

419.1.3.2 Sliding doorsWhere doors in a means of egress are of the hdalzon
sliding type, the force to slide the door to ithyfopen position shall not exceed 50
pounds (220 N) with a perpendicular force againstdoor of 50 pounds (220 N).

419.1.3.3 Spiral stairsSpiral stairs that conform to the requirements eft®n
1009.8 shall be permitted.

419.1.3.4 LocksEgress doors shall be permitted to be locked inr@emnce with
Exception 4 of Section 1008.1.8.3.

419.1.4 Vertical openingskloor openings between floor levels of a residemog{ unit
are permitted without enclosure.

419.1.5 Fire protection.The residence/work unit shall be provided with anitaoed fire
alarm system where required by Section 907.2.%dinel sprinkler system in accordance
with Section 903.2.7.

419.1.6 Structural. Floor loading for the areas within a residence/wank shall be
designed to conform to Table 1607.1 based on thetitn within the space.

419.1.7 AccessibilityAccessibility shall be designed in accordance Wikiapter 11.

419.1.8 Ventilation.The applicable requirements of tikernational Mechanical Code
shall apply to each area within the residence/waorkfor the function within that space.



419.2 Separation wallsWalls separating dwelling units in the same buddand walls
separating sleeping units in the same buildingl db@alconstructed as fire partitions in
accordance with Section 708.

419.3 Horizontal separationFloor assemblies separating dwelling units in #reebuildings
and floor assemblies separating sleeping uniteensame building shall be constructed as
horizontal assemblies in accordance with Sectidn71

(12) Section 505.2s amended by the addition of a new exception rendko read as follows:

“3. Within individual dwelling units of Group R oapancies, the maximum aggregate area of
a mezzanine may be equal to one-half of the ardreeabom in which it is located, without
being considered an additional story; and to atlievmezzanine to be closed to the room
in which it is located, provided exits from the raamine are in conformance with Section
505.3.”

(13) Section 506.4s amended in the following respects:
(a) Subsection 506.4.1, Mixed occupancisgmended by renumbering as, “506.4.1.1.”

(b) Section506.4s amended to read as follows:

“506.4 Buildings with more than one storyThe total allowable building area of a building
with more than one story shall be determined iroetance with this section. The actual
aggregate building area at all stories in the lngidshall not exceed the total allowable
building area.
Exception: A single basement need not be included in the &dialvable building area,
provided such basement does not exceed the anaitteerfor a building with no more
than one story above grade plane.

506.4.1 Area determinationThe total allowable building area of a buildinglwmore
than one story above grade plane shall be detedbyeultiplying the allowable area
per story Ad), as determined in Section 506.1, by the numbstafes above grade
plane as listed below:
1. For buildings with two stories above grade pJaneltiply by 2;
2. For buildings with three or more stories aboradg plane, multiply by 3; and
3. No story shall exceed the allowable area pey $&®), as determined in Section
506.1, for the occupancies on that story.

Exceptions:

1. Unlimited area buildings in accordance with #ecb07.

2. The maximum area of a building equipped througkath an automatic sprinkler
system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2 skalkbermined by multiplying the
allowable area per stofp,), as determined in Section 506.1, by the number of
stories above grade plane.”

10



(14) Section 509.% amended to read as follows:

“509.5 Group R-1 and R-2 buildings of Type IIIA corstruction. The height limitation for
buildings of Type IlIIA construction in Groups R-AdR-2 shall be increased to six stories and
75 feet (22 860 mm) where the first-floor constimciabove the basement has a fire-resistance
rating of not less than 3 hours and the floor esabdivided by 2-hour fire-resistance-rated
fire walls into areas of not more than 3,000 sqteee (279 m).”

(15) Section 509.6s amended to read as follows:

“509.6 Group R-1 and R-2 buildings of Type IIA congruction. The height limitation for
buildings of Type IIA construction in Groups R-1d8R-2 shall be increased to nine stories and
100 feet (30 480 mm) where the building is sepdraienot less than 50 feet (15 240 mm)
from any other building on the lot and from lotds) the exits are segregated in an area
enclosed by a 2-hour fire-resistance-rated fird amad the first-floor construction has a fire-
resistance rating of not less than 1% hours.”

(16) Section 702s amended by deleting the definitiofIRE AREA.

(17) Section 704.3s amended by adding a third paragraph to reddllasvs:

“Lines or walls which are established solely tamkehte individual portions of a building or of
a planned unit development (PUD) need not be censitias property lines for the purposes of
this code, provided that such building is entilelyated on property which is under common
ownership and further provided that required dis¢snset forth in Section 503.3 for assumed
property lines between buildings located on theesproperty, are maintained.”

11



(18) Table 704.8s amended to read :

TABLE 704.8

MAXIMUM AREA OF EXTERIOR WALL OPENINGS BASED ON FIRE
SEPARATION DISTANCE AND DEGREE OF OPENING PROTECTION

FIRE SEPARATION DISTANCE (ft)

DEGREE OF OPENING PROTECTION

ALLOWABLE AREAa

Oto less than 3 b, ¢

Unprotected, Nonsprinklered (UP, NS)

Not Permitted

Unprotected, sprinklered (UP, S) i

Not Permitted

Protected (P)

Not Permitted

3 to less than 54, e

Unprotected, Nonsprinklered (UP, NS)

Not Permitted

30 or greater

Unprotected, sprinklered (UP, S) i 15%
Protected (P) 15%
Unprotected, Nonsprinklered (UP, NS) 10% n
5to less than 10e.f Unprotected, sprinklered (UP, S) i 25%
Protected (P) 25%
Unprotected, Nonsprinklered (UP, NS) 15% n
10to less than 15e.1. Unprotected, sprinklered (UP, S) i 45%
Protected (P) 45%
Unprotected, Nonsprinklered (UP, NS) 25%
15 to less than 201, Unprotected, sprinklered (UP, S) i 75%
Protected (P) 75%
Unprotected, Nonsprinklered (UP, NS) 45%
20 to less than 251, Unprotected, sprinklered (UP, S) i No Limit
Protected (P) No Limit
Unprotected, Nonsprinklered (UP, NS) 70%
25 to less than 30r.g Unprotected, sprinklered (UP, S) i No Limit
Protected (P) No Limit
Unprotected, Nonsprinklered (UP, NS) No Limit

Unprotected, sprinklered (UP, S) i

Not Required

Protected (P)

Not Required

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

UP, NS = Unprotected openings in buildings not equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in

accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.

UP, S = Unprotected openings in buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance

12




with Section 903.3.1.1.
P = Openings protected with an opening protective assembly in accordance with Section 704.8.2.

a. Values indicated are the percentage of the area of the exterior wall, per story.

b. For the requirements for fire walls of buildings with differing heights, see Section 705.6.1.

c. For openings in a fire wall for buildings on the same lot, see Section 705.8.

d. The maximum percentage of unprotected and protected openings shall be 25 percent for Group R
occupancies.

e. Unprotected openings shall not be permitted for openings with a fire separation distance of less than 15
feet for Group H-2 and H-3 occupancies.

f. The area of unprotected and protected openings shall not be limited for Group R-3 occupancies, with a
fire separation distance of 5 feet or greater.

g. The area of openings in an open parking structure with a fire separation distance of 10 feet or greater
shall not be limited.

h. Includes buildings accessory to Group R-3.

i. Not applicable to Group H-1, H-2 and H-3 occupancies.

(19) Section 714s amended in the following respects:
(a) Section 714.1s amended by adding two new subsections to reéallaws:

“714.1.1 Primary structural frame. The primary structural frame shall be the columns
and other structural members including the girdeesms, trusses and spandrels having
direct connections to the columns and bracing mesntbesigned to carry gravity loads.

714.1.2 Secondary membershe members of floor or roof construction that ace
connected to the columns shall be considered sacpmiembers and not part of the
primary structural frame.”

(b) A new,Subsection 714.8s added to read as follows:

“714.8 Sprayed fire-resistant materials (SFRM).Sprayed fire-resistant materials
(SFRM) shall comply with Sections 714.8.1 throud.B.4.

714.8.1 Fire-resistance ratingThe application of SFRM shall be consistent whihfire
resistance rating and the listing, including, battlrmited to, minimum thickness and dry
density of the applied SFRM, method of applicatsfystrate surface conditions; and the
use of bonding adhesives, sealants, reinforcirgjtaer materials.

714.8.2 Manufacturer's installation instructions.The application of SFRM shall be in
accordance with the manufacturer’s installatiotruggions. The instructions shall include,
but are not limited to, substrate temperaturessaridce conditions and SFRM handling,
storage, mixing, conveyance, method of applicatoming and ventilation.

714.8.3 Substrate conditionThe SFRM shall be applied to a substrate in comgdavith
Sections 714.8.3.1 through 714.8.3.2.

13



714.8.3.1 Surface conditionsSubstrates to receive SFRM shall be free of dikt, o
grease, release agents, loose scale and any otigitian that prevents adhesion.
The substrates shall also be free of primers, paimil encapsulants other than those
fire tested and listed by a nationally recognizesting agency. Primed, painted or
encapsulated steel shall be allowed, provided td&itng has demonstrated that
required adhesion is maintained.

714.8.3.2 Primers, paints and encapsulanté/here the SFRM is to be applied over
primers, paints or encapsulants other than thosefsgd in the listing, the material
shall be field tested in accordance with ASTM E . ABfere testing of the SFRM
with primers, paints or encapsulants demonstrates tequired adhesion is
maintained, SFRM shall be permitted to be appliedptimed, painted or
encapsulated wide flange steel shapes in accordatitéhe following conditions:
1. The beam flange width does not exceed 12 in@@smm); or

2. The column flange width does not exceed 16 in¢h€0 mm); or

3. The beam or column web depth does not exceaachés (400 mm).

4. The average and minimum bond strength valudsIishaetermined based on a
minimum of five bond tests conducted in accordamite ASTM E 736. Bond tests
conducted in accordance with ASTM E 736 shall iatha minimum average bond
strength of 80 percent and a minimum individualdstiength of 50 percent, when
compared to the bond strength of the SFRM as apfsielean uncoated 1/8-inch-
thick (3-mm) steel plate.

714.8.4 Temperature A minimum ambient and substrate temperature of 40%4°C)
shall be maintained during and for a minimum off@urs after the application of the
SFRM, unless the manufacturer’s installation indtams allow otherwise.

714.8.5 Finished condition.The finished condition of SFRM applied to structura
members or assemblies shall not, upon completagloi curing, exhibit cracks, voids,
spalls, delamination or any exposure of the sutest&urface irregularities of SFRM shall
be deemed acceptable.”

14



(20) Table 715.5s amended to read as follows:

TABLE 715.5
FIRE WINDOW ASSEMBLY FIRE PROTECTION RATINGS
TYPE OF ASSEMBLY REQUIRED ASSEMBLY MINIMUM FIRE WINDOW
RATING (hours) ASSEMBLY RATING(hours)
Interior Fire walls All NP?
walls:
a
Fire barriers e Sl
1 3/4
Smoke barriers 1 3/4
Fire partitions 2 o
1/2 1/3
Exterior walls
>1 11/2
1 3/4
Party wall All NP

NP = Not Permitted.
a. Not permitted except as specified in Section 715.2.

(21) Section 716.% amended in the following respects:
(a) Section 716.5.1s amended by adding a n&ubsection 716.5.1.1o read as follows:

“716.5.1.1 Horizontal Exits. A listed smoke damper designed to resist the passhg
smoke shall be provided at each point a ductrdramsfer opening penetrates a fire
wall that serves as a horizontal exit.”

(b) Section 716.5.3, Shaft enclosuisgmended by adding a new exception nurblberead
as follows:

(c) “5. Fire dampers and combination fire/smoke damaersnot required in kitchen and
clothes dryer exhaust system when installed imrm@ence with thénternational
Mechanical Codé

(d) Two new subsections are added in numericalesegpito read as follows:
“716.5.6 Exterior walls. Ducts and air transfer openings in fire-resistaiated exterior
walls required to have protected openings in aamd with Section 704.14 shall be

protected with listed fire dampers installed in@dance with their listing.

716.5.7 Smoke partitionsA listed smoke damper designed to resist the pasgagnoke
15



shall be provided at each point that an air trangbening penetrates a smoke patrtition.
Smoke dampers and smoke damper actuation methadls cemply with Section
716.3.2.1.

Exception: Where the installation of a smoke damper will ifesx with the
operation of a required smoke control system irmoatance with Section 909,
approved alternate protection shall be utilized.”

(22) Section 717.2.1s amended to read as follows:

“717.2.1 Fireblocking materials.Fireblocking shall consist of the following matésia

1. Two-inch (51 mm) nominal lumber.

2. Two thicknesses of 1-inch (25 mm) nominal lumieh broken lap joints.

3. One thickness of 0.719-inch (18.3 mm) wood s$tmat panels with joints backed by
0.719- inch (18.3 mm) wood structural panels.

4. One thickness of 0.75-inch (19.1 mm) particledoaith joints backed by 0.75-inch (19
mm) particleboard.

5. One half-inch (12.7 mm) Gypsum board.

6. One fourth-inch (6.4 mm) Cement-based millboard.

7. Batts or blankets of mineral wool, mineral filmegrother approved materials installed in
such a manner as to be securely retained in place.

717.2.1.1 Batts or blankets of mineral wool or mirmal fiber. Batts or blankets of

mineral wool or mineral fiber or other approved ngidl materials shall be permitted for
compliance with the 10-foot (3048 mm) horizontaélilocking in walls constructed
using parallel rows of studs or staggered studs.

717.2.1.2 Unfaced fiberglasgJnfaced fiberglass batt insulation used as firdhlag
shall fill the entire cross section of the wall itgto a minimum height of 16 inches (406
mm) measured vertically. When piping, conduit amifar obstructions are encountered,
the insulation shall be packed tightly around thstauction.

717.2.1.3 Loose-fill insulation materialLoose-fill insulation material, insulating foam
sealants and caulk materials shall not be usedigbbock unless specifically tested in
the form and manner intended for use to demonstsability to remain in place and to
retard the spread of fire and hot gases.

717.2.1.4 Fireblocking integrity.The integrity of fireblocks shall be maintained.
717.2.1.5 Double stud wallsBatts or blankets of mineral or glass fiber or othe

approved nonrigid materials shall be allowed abfwcking in walls constructed using
parallel rows of studs or staggered studs.

16



(23) Section 902.1s amended by adding two new definitions in algtealal order to read as
follows:

“FIRE AREA. The aggregate floor area enclosed and boundedeowélls, fire barriers,
exterior walls or fire-resistance-rated horizordasemblies of a building. Areas of the
building not provided with surrounding walls shadl included in the fire area if such areas
are included within the horizontal projection bétroof or floor above.”

FIRE CONTAINMENT AREA is a portion of a story or basement which is tp&iclosed by

a smoke and draft barrier of not less than 1-hwafrésistive construction and as prescribed
herein. All door openings penetrating such firetaorment areas shall be protected by tight-
fitting smoke and draft control assemblies as $ekin Section 715.4.3 except that such doors
shall be automatic closing by actuation of a snatkector in accordance with Section 715.4.7.3.
All duct penetrations shall be protected by damperaplying with Section 716.5.4.1 with a
minimum leakage classification of Ill, except tsath dampers shall be automatic closing by
actuation of a smoke detector. Openings other ttwors and ducts shall be protected as
specified in Section 715.5 and shall be limited tnaximum of twenty-five (25) percent of any
one (1) wall. Self-closing devices may be useddn bf automatic closing devices on doors
unlikely to be fixed open during normal conditioBxamples are doors at toilet room, vertical
stairways, closets and small storage rooms andiesiareas.”

(24) Section 903s amended in the following respects:
(a) A newTable 903.1is added as follows:
Table903.1, Maximum Allowable Fire-Containment Area added to read as follows:

“TABLE 903.1
MAXIMUM ALLOWABLE FIRE-CONTAINMENT AREA
(IN SQUARE FEET)

Types of Construction

| Occupancy| IA | IB | IIA [IIB|IIIA [HIB[IV-HT| VA | VB
AL 110,00010,000 NP| NP| NP| NP| NP| NP| NP
A2, 110,000110,000 5,000/5,000 5,000/5,000/ 5,000 5,000 5,00C

A3, 4 110,00010,000 5,000/5,000/ 5,000/5,000, 5,000 5,000/5,000
‘BL’J' F1, M, Sl<10,00(+10,00(+ 7,000/5,000 7,000‘5,000‘ 7,000‘ 7,000‘ 5,00(
F2, S2 20,000120,00010,0007,000110,0007,000/10,000110,000 5,00C
E 110,000110,000 7,000/5,000/ 7,000/5,000, 7,000/ 7,000 5,00C

NP = Not Permitted”
(b) Section 903.2s amended by adding an exception nun#erread as follows:

17



“2. Except for Occupancies with a Group R fire areaccordance with Section 903.2.7,
an automatic sprinkler system shall be installeallibuildings which are not divided
into fire containment areas as specified in Tab@..”

(25) Section 907.2.10.1i% amended by adding a new itetmto read as follows:

“4. Additions, alterations or repairs to Group R Ocapancies.When one (1) or more
sleeping rooms are added or created in existing®iRoOccupancies, the entire dwelling
unit shall be provided with smoke detectors locaad installed as required for new
Group R Occupancies described herein.”

(26) Section 912.8 amended by adding two new subsections in nuedesider to read as
follows:

“912.3.2 Clear space around connectioné working space of not less than 36 inches (762
mm) in width, 36 inches (914 mm) in depth and 7&éhas (1981 mm) in height shall be
provided and maintained in front of and to the sidé¢ wall-mounted fire department
connections and around the circumference of fraedatg fire department connections, except
as otherwise required or approved by the fire chief

912.3.3 Physical protectionWhere fire department connections are subject fmohby a
motor vehicle, vehicle impact protection shall bevided in accordance with Section 312 of
thelnternational Fire Codé.

(27Chapter 9, FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEM%mended by adding né&ections913and914, at
the end of the chapter to read in numerical secquaadollows:

“SECTION 913 FIRE PUMPS

913.1 GeneralWhere provided, fire pumps shall be installed iooadance with this section
and NFPA 20.

913.2 Protection against interruption of serviceThe fire pump, driver and controller shall
be protected in accordance with NFPA 20 againssiptesinterruption of service through
damage caused by explosion, fire, flood, earthquaddents, insects, windstorm, freezing,
vandalism and other adverse conditions.

913.3 Temperature of pump room.Suitable means shall be provided for maintainirey th
temperature of a pump room or pump house, whergrezl] above 40°F (5°C).

913.3.1 Engine manufacturer’s recommendationTemperature of the pump room,
pump house or area where engines are installetirshadr be less than the minimum
recommended by the engine manufacturer. The entanefacturer’'s recommendations
for oil heaters shall be followed.

18



913.4 Valve supervisionWhere provided, the fire pump suction, dischargelampass valves,
and the isolation valves on the backflow preventierice or assembly shall be supervised
open by one of the following methods.

1. Central-station, proprietary or remote-statimmaling service.

2. Local signaling service that will cause the sbog of an audible signal at a constantly
attended location.

3. Locking valves open.

4. Sealing of valves and approved weekly recordspaction where valves are located within
fenced enclosures under the control of the owner.

913.4.1 Test outlet valve supervisiorkire pump test outlet valves shall be supervised
in the closed position.

913.5 Acceptance tesAcceptance testing shall be done in accordancetingthequirements
of NFPA 20.

SECTION 914 EMERGENCY RESPONDER SAFETY FEATURES
914.1 Shaftway markingsVertical shafts shall be identified as requiredliiog section.

914.1.1 Exterior access to shaftwaysOutside openings accessible to the fire
department and that open directly on a hoistwaaftway communicating between two
or more floors in a building shall be plainly madkeith the word SHAFTWAY in red
letters at least 6 inches (152 mm) high on a watgkground. Such warning signs shall
be placed so as to be readily discernible fronotitside of the building.

914.1.2 Interior access to shaftwaydoor or window openings to a hoistway or
shaftway from the interior of the building shall p&inly marked with the word
“SHAFTWAY” in red letters at least 6 inches (152 ningh on a white background.
Such warning signs shall be placed so as to bélyehscernible.

Exception: Markings shall not be required on shaftway openitigg are readily
discernible as openings onto a shaftway by thetoaetgon or arrangement.

914.2 Equipment room identification.Fire protection equipment shall be identified in an
approved manner. Rooms containing controls focanditioning systems, sprinkler risers and
valves or other fire detection, suppression orrabeiements shall be identified for the use of
the fire department. Approved signs required tantdie fire protection equipment and
equipment location shall be constructed of duratdeerials, permanently installed and readily
visible.

(28) Section 1002.is amended by adding a new definitiéi,IGHT, to read as follows:
19



“FLIGHT. A continuous run of rectangular treads, windersaonbination thereof from one
landing to another consisting of more than one tise

(29) Section 1007.8 amended to read as follows:

“1007.3 Exit stairways.In order to be considered part of an accessiblexmebegress, an

exit stairway shall have a clear width of 48 inc{iEs19 mm) minimum between handrails and

shall either incorporate an area of refuge witmnealarged floor-level landing or shall be

accessed from either an area of refuge complyitig 8&ction 1007.6 or a horizontal exit.
Exceptions:

1. The area of refuge is not required at unenclogedor exit stairways as permitted
by Section 1020.1 in buildings or facilitiggt more than 4 stories above grade
plane, that are equipped throughout with an automatiokler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.

2. The clear width of 48 inches (1219 mm) betweamdhnails is not required at exit
stairways in buildings or facilitiegot more than 4 stories above grade plane
equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkleteysinstalled in accordance
with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.

3. Areas of refuge are not required at exit staygva buildings or facilitiegot more
than 4 stories above grade planequipped throughout by an automatic sprinkler
system installed in accordance with Section 903131 903.3.1.2.

4. The clear width of 48 inches (1219 mm) betweamdhnails is not required for exit
stairways accessed from a horizontal exit.

5. Areas of refuge are not required at exit staysaserving open parking garages.

6. Areas of refuge are not required for smoke gteteseating areas complying with
Section 1025.6.2.

7. The areas of refuge are not required in GrodReupancies.”

(30) Section 1007.45 amended in its entirety to read as follows:

1007.4 Elevatorsin order to be considered part of an accessiblenmebegress, an elevator
shall comply with the emergency operation and siggalevice requirements of Section 2.27
of ASME A17.1. Standby power shall be provided acadance with Sections 2702 and
3003. The elevator shall be accessed from eitherea of refuge complying with Section
1007.6 or a horizontal exit.

Exceptions:

1. Elevators are not required to be accessed froarea of refuge or horizontal exit in
open parking garages.

2. Elevators are not required to be accessed froarea of refuge or horizontal exit in
buildings and facilities equipped throughout byaatomatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.

3. Elevators not required to be located in a Shadtcordance with Section 707.2 are not
required to be accessed from an area of refugerardmtal exit.

20



4. Elevators are not required to be accessed froarea of refuge or horizontal exit for
smoke protected seating areas complying with Sedi®25.6.2.

5. Elevators in buildings or facilitiesot more than 4 stories above grade planare not
required to be accessiblehen equipped throughout by an _automatic sprinkler
system installed in accordance with Section 903.311or 903.3.1.2.

(31) Section 1008.1is amended by adding a third paragraph theretead as follows:

“Other doors which are neither required nor usedeat purposes need not conform to this
Chapter, provided such doors cannot be readilytnged as exits by building occupants. Such
doors shall be rendered inoperable, provided soctsaio not have grasping hardware, closers
or exit signs installed thereon and are made teappconspicuous or resemble the adjacent
wall construction or are provided with an obvioasrizade.”

(32) Section 1008.1.%5 amended in the following respects:
a) A new,Exception 6, imdded thereto to read as follows:

“6. Exterior doors, other than the main entrancerdo a dwelling unit, may open at one
intervening exterior step that is equally spacetvben the interior floor level above
and exterior landing below, provided the stepaasnimum tread depth of twelve
(12) inches, a maximum riser height of seven ¥esd@.75”), and a minimum width
equal to the door width; and provided the door dugsswing over the step.”

b) A second paragraph is added at the end thereaat as follows:

“All exterior steps, slabs, walks, decks and pasiessing as exterior door landings or
exterior stairs shall be adequately and permansatyred in place by approved methods
to prevent such landings or stairs from being umieed or subject to significant
displacement due to improper placement of supppriackfill or due to inadequate
anchoring methods.”

(33) Section 1008.1.8 amended by adding a new subsection at the esrdahin numerical
sequence to read as follows:

“1008.1.8.8 Electromagnetically locked egress dooiBoors in the means of egress that are
not otherwise required to have panic hardware ildimgs with an occupancy in Group A, B,
E, M, R-1 or R-2 and doors to tenant spaces in @W®uB, E, M, R-1 or R-2 shall be
permitted to be electromagnetically locked if equai@ with listed hardware that incorporates a
built-in switch and meet the following requirements

1. The listed hardware that is affixed to the deaf has an obvious method of operation
that is readily operated under all lighting corahs.

2. The listed hardware is capable of being openatddone hand.

3. Operation of the listed hardware releases t@kbetromagnetic lock and unlocks the
door immediately.

21



4. Loss of power to the listed hardware automdyicallocks the door.”
(34) Section 1009.1& amended by replacing in its entirety to reatbdsws:
“1009.10 Handrails.Stairwayf more than one risershall have handrails on each side and

shall comply with Section 1012. Where glass is usqutovide the handrail, the handrail shalll
also comply with Section 2407.

Exceptions:

1. Handrails for aisle stairs are not required whmarmitted by Section 1025.13.

2. Stairways within dwelling units, spiral stairvgegnd aisle stairs serving seating only
on one side are permitted to have a handrail orsmi®eonly.

3. Decks, patios and walkways that have a singlegéin elevation where the landing
depth on each side of the change of elevationaatgr than what is required for a
landing do not require handrails.

4. In Group R-3 occupancies, a change in elevatomsisting of a single riser at an
entrance or egress door does not require handrails.

5. Changes in room elevation$ three or fewer risers within dwelling units and
sleeping units in Group R-2 and R-3 do not regh@edrails.”

(35) Section 1012.8 amended by replacing in its entirety to reatbsws:

1012.3 Handrail graspability.All required handrails shall meet Type | critergafallows or
shall provide equivalent graspability.

Type |. Handrails with a circular cross-section shall haneutside diameter of at least 1.25
inches (32 mm) and not greater than 2 inches (5). mite handrail is not circular, it shall
have a perimeter dimension of at least 4 inche? fii®) and not greater than 6.25 inches (160
mm) with a maximum cross-section dimension of drifhes (57 mm). Edges shall have a
minimum radius of 0.01 inch (0.25 mm).

Exception: In Group R-3 occupancies; within dwelling unitSGnoup R-2 occupancies;
and in Group U occupancies that are accessorgtoap R-3 occupancy or accessory to
individual dwelling units in Group R-2occupancibandrails shall be Type I, Type Il as
follows or shall provide equivalent graspability.

Type Il. Handrails with a perimeter greater than 6.25 incfi€&® mm) shall provide a
graspable finger recess area on both sides ofttigep The finger recess shall begin within a
distance of 0.75 inch (19 mm) measured verticatiynf the tallest portion of the profile and
achieve a depth of at least .3125 inch (8 mm) withB75 inch (22 mm) below the widest
portion of the profile. This required depth shahtinue for at least 0.375 inch (10mm) to a
level that is not less than 1.75 inches (45 mmdwehe tallest portion of the profile. The
minimum width of the handrail above the recessldieal.25 inches (32 mm) to a maximum
of 2.75 inches (70 mm). Edges shall have a minimadfius of 0.01 inch (0.25 mm).

22



(36) Section 1013% amended by adding a new subsection at thenemeldf in numerical sequence
to read as follows:

“1013.7"All area wells, stair wells and light wells atteszl to any building that are located less
than thirty-six (36) inches from the nearest inhdalking surface and deeper than thirty-six
(36) inches below the surrounding ground levelatng an opening with a horizontal
dimension greater than twenty-four (24) inches mesbperpendicular from the building, with
the side walls of such well having a slope sted¢pan 2 horizontal to 1 vertical, shall be

protected with guardrails conforming to this Sectoound the entire opening, or be provided
with an equivalent barrier.

EXCEPTIONS:
1. The access side of stairways need not be bdedca

2. Area wells provided for emergency escape amisa&indows may be protected with
approved grates or covers that comply with Secti@26.4 of this code.

3. Covers and grates may be used over stairwaysthadopenings used exclusively for
service access or for admitting light or ventilatio

(37) Subsection 1014.% amended in the following respects:

(a) Subsection 1014.2.%5 amended to read as follows:

“1014.2.2 Group I-2.Habitable rooms or suites in Group I-2 occupansies| have an
exit access door leading directly to a corridor.

Exception: Rooms with exit doors opening directly to the adgsat ground level.”
(b) NewSubsections 1014.2.8nd1014.2.4 are added at the end thereof to read as follows:

“1014.2.3 Suites in patient sleeping areafPatient sleeping areas in Group I-2
Occupancies shall be permitted to be divided iottes with one intervening room if one
of the following conditions is met:

1. The intervening room within the suite is notdiss an exit access for more than
eight patient beds.

2. The arrangement of the suite allows for dirext eonstant visual supervision by
nursing personnel.

1014.2.3.1 AreaSuites of sleeping rooms shall not exceed 5,00arsdaet (465 RA).

1014.2.3.2 Exit acces#&ny patient sleeping room, or any suite that inelug@atient
sleeping rooms, of more than 1,000 square feetm®3hall have at least two exit

23



access doors remotely located from each other.

1014.2.3.3 Travel distanceThe travel distance between any point in a suite of
sleeping rooms and an exit access door of that shdll not exceed 100 feet (30 480
mm).

1014.2.4 Suites in areas other than patient sleegirareas.Areas other than patient
sleeping areas in Group I-2 occupancies shall baigied to be divided into suites.

1014.2.4.1 AreaSuites of rooms, other than patient sleeping roaimal] not exceed
10,000 square feet (929

1014.2.4.2 Exit accesgny room or suite of rooms, other than patientglegrooms,
of more than 2,500 square feet (232) shall have at least two exit access doors
remotely located from each other.

1014.2.4.3 One intervening roonf-or rooms other than patient sleeping rooms, suites
of rooms are permitted to have one intervening rddhe travel distance within the
suite to the exit access door is not greater tid@nfdet (30480 mm).

1014.2.4.4 Two intervening roomsFor rooms other than patient sleeping rooms
located within a suite, exit access travel fromhwitthe suite shall be permitted
through two intervening rooms where the travelatise to the exit access door is not
greater than 50 feet (15 240 mm).

1014.2.5 Travel distanceThe travel distance between any point in a Gro@p I-
occupancy patient sleeping room and an exit actmssin that room shall not exceed
50 feet (15 240 mm).

1014.2.6 SeparationSuites in Group I-2 occupancies shall be sepafabed other
portions of the building by a smoke partition coympd with Section 710.”

(38) Section 1020.1.8 amended by adding a new subsection to reaallaw$:

“1020.1.6.1 Signage requirementsStairway identification signs shall comply with afithe
following requirements:
1. The signs shall be a minimum size of 18 incd&3 (mm) by 12 inches (305 mm).
2. The letters designating the identification @& fair enclosure shall be a minimum of 1
Y% inches (38 mm) in height.
3. The number designating the floor level shalab@inimum of 5 inches (127 mm) in
height and located in the center of the sign.
4. All other lettering and numbers shall be a mummof 1 inch (22 mm) in height.
5. Characters and their background shall have agfee finish. Characters shall contrast
with their background, with either light charactens a dark background or dark

24



characters on a light background.”

(39) Section 1026.1Exceptions,amended to read as follows:.

“1. The emergency escape and rescue opening istfeo open onto a balcony within an
atrium in accordance with the requirements of $act4, provided the balcony provides
access to an exit and the dwelling unit or sleepini¢ has a means of egress that is not
open to the atrium.

2. Basements with a ceiling height of less thamnches (1829 mmghall not be required to
have emergency escape and rescue windows.

3. High-rise buildings in accordance with Secti®34

4. Emergency escape and rescue openings are noecffom basements or sleeping rooms
that have an exit door or exit access door that@geectly into a public way or to a yard,
court or exterior exit balcony that opens to a muky.

5. Basements without habitable spaces and havimyate than 200 square feet (18%in
floor area shall not be required to have emergescgpe windows.”

(40) CHAPTER 10s amended by adding a new section at the enddahtereead as follows:
“SECTION 1027 — EXIT PATH MARKINGS (High Rise)

1027.1 GeneralApproved luminous markings delineating the exihpstiall be provided in
exit enclosures, including vertical exit enclosuard exit passageways, of buildings of Group
A, B, E, I, M, and R-1 having occupied floors lam@dimore than 75 feet (22 860 mm) above
the lowest level of fire department vehicle accass shall comply with Sections 1027.1.1
through 1027.1.7.

Exception: Exit path markings shall not be required in lobboesareas of open parking
garages, where such lobby or area is located olevie€of exit discharge and complies with
the exception to Section 1023.1.

1027.1.1 StepsA stripe shall be applied to the horizontal leadialge of each step and
shall extend for the full length of the step. Cuitlg stripes shall have a minimum
horizontal width of 1 inch (25 mm) and a maximundthi of 2 inches (51 mm). The
leading edge of the stripe shall be placed at aiimax of %2 inch (13 mm) from the
leading edge of the step and the stripe shall vedap the leading edge of the step by not
more than %2 inch (13 mm) down the vertical facéhefstep.

1027.1.2 LandingsThe leading edge of landings shall be marked w#tnipe consistent
with the dimensional requirements for steps.

25



1027.1.3 Handrails:All handrails and handrail extensions shall be radnwith a stripe
having a minimum width of 1 inch (25 mm). The strghall be placed on the top surface
of the handrail for the entire length of the hailgnacluding extensions and newel post
caps. Where handrails or handrail extensions bendmcorners, the stripe shall not have
a gap of more than 4 inches (102 mm).

1027.1.4 Perimeter demarcation linesStair landings and other floor areas within exit
enclosures, with the exception of the sides ofsstepall be provided with demarcation
lines on the floor or on the walls or a combinatdioth. The stripes shall be 1 (25 mm)
to 2 inches (51 mm) wide with interruptions notegding 4 inches (102 mm).

1027.1.4.1 Floor mounted demarcation line®erimeter demarcation lines shall be
placed within 4 inches of the wall and shall extemdithin 2 inches (51 mm) of the
markings on the leading edge of landings. The deatian lines shall continue
across the floor in front of all doors.

Exception: Demarcation lines shall not extend in front of @abrs that lead out of
an exit enclosure and through which occupants magl to complete the exit path.

1027.1.4.2 Wall mounted demarcation line?erimeter demarcation lines shall be
placed on the wall with the bottom edge of thepstmo more than 4 inches (102
mm) above the finished floor. At the top or bottofithe stairs, demarcation lines
shall drop vertically to the floor within 2 inchésl mm) of the step or landing edge.
Demarcation lines on walls shall transition veliticéo the floor and then extend
across the floor where a line on the floor is thiy practical method of outlining the
path. Where the wall line is broken by a door, deai@on lines on walls shall
continue across the face of the door or transtiotne floor and extend across the
floor in front of such doors.

Exception: Demarcation lines shall not extend in front of @abrs that lead out of
an exit enclosure and through which occupants magl to complete the exit path.

1027.1.4.3 TransitionWhere a wall mounted demarcation line transitioresftoor
mounted demarcation line, or vice-versa, the walnted demarcation line shall
drop vertically to the floor to meet a complimegtaxtension of the floor mounted
demarcation line, thus forming a continuous marking

1027.1.5 Uniformity.Placement and dimensions of markings shall be stargiand uniform
throughout the same exit enclosure.

1027.1.6 Materials.Luminescent exit path markings shall be permittetd¢é made of any
material, including paint, provided that an elexticharge is not required to maintain the
required luminance. Such materials shall include not limited to, self-luminous materials
and photoluminescent materials. Materials shallggwith either:

1. UL 1994, or

2. ASTM E 2072, except that the charging sourcdl $lea1 fc (10 lux) of fluorescent

26



illumination for 60 minutes, and the minimum luntmaa shall be 5 milicandelas per square
meter after 90 minutes.

1027.1.7 lllumination. Exit enclosures where photoluminescent exit pattkmgs are
installed shall be provided with the minimum meahesgress illumination required by
Section 1006 for at least 60 minutes prior to pgievhen the building is occupied.

(41) Section1103.1is amended by adding second and third paragrasipectively thereto to
read as follows:

“Nothing in this code shall be construed as rehgwr waiving compliance with Colorado law
as set forth in Section 9-5-101 et seq., C.R.S.

When the Building Review Board considers grantirgegtions or variances either to this
chapter pursuant to Section 112 of this code @dlorado Statutes pursuant to Section 9-5-
102, C.R.S,, it shall require the applicant requgghe exception or variance to demonstrate
that the application of a particular standard @cgration relating to access for persons with
disabilities would impose an extraordinary hardsinghe subject property. For the purposes
of this Section, an extraordinary hardship shathma substantial and unusual hardship which
is the direct result of unique physical site coiodis such as terrain, topography or geology; or,
which is the direct result of other unique or specbnditions encountered on the subject
property, but which are not typically encounterddewhere in the city. Constraints,
complications or difficulties that may arise by qaging with this chapter and/or with the
statutory standards for accessibility but that dbaonstitute an extraordinary hardship shall
not serve to justify the granting of an exceptiowvariance.”

(42) Section1107.2is amended by adding second and third paragrasipectively thereto to
read as follows:

“When any building or buildings, classified as GodR, Division 1 or Group R, Division 2
Occupancy, are constructed as a single buildinggir¢or any phase thereof) on any one site
and such building project (or phase) contains eameaye accessible dwelling units as required
by this chapter or Colorado law, said building padj(or phase) shall be constructed such that
all such required accessible dwelling units in dugitding project (or phase) provide the same
functional features as are provided in the nonatilesunits in such building project (or
phase). Furthermore, such functional features axoegwelling unit bedroom-types shall be
provided in the same proportion as in the nonadadessnits. Not less than 50% of the
required accessible dwelling units shall be comrstéa with the distribution of accessible
dwelling unit bedroom-types being proportionallg 8ame as the distribution of nonaccessible
dwelling unit bedroom-types, provided that at leas of each dwelling unit bedroom-type
constructed in the building project (or phase) Idb@lan accessible dwelling unit.

For purposes of this Section, the following defans shall apply: 'Dwelling unit bedroom-
type' shall mean the number of bedrooms withindilvelling unit. 'Functional feature' shall
mean: a closet, a garage, a carport, a patio, lg ddditional rooms (such as a bedroom,

27



bathroom, den, storeroom, laundry or similar roamg any other significant feature built at
the time of original construction that offers ocanfs improved convenience or comfort.
Aesthetic or decorative features such as colochjtactural design elements, trim and finish
materials, decorative heating appliances not pmgidhe primary comfort heat source,
lighting fixture style, cabinet and hardware stylkeimbing fixture style, the type and location
of windows and glazed lights, or any similar mitmetous features shall not be construed as
functional features”

(43) Section 1108.4.1s amended to read as follows:

“1108.4.1 Courtrooms. Each courtroom shall be accessible and comply Biltions
1108.4.1.1 through 1108.4.1.5.

1108.4.1.1 Jury boxA wheelchair space complying with ICC A117.1 shwlprovided
within the jury box.
Exception: Adjacent companion seating is not required.

1108.4.1.2 Gallery seatingWheelchair spaces complying with ICC A117.1 shall b
provided in accordance with Table 1108.2.2.1. Destigd aisle seats shall be provided in
accordance with Section 1108.2.4.

1108.4.1.3 Assistive listening systen®n assistive listening system must be provided.
Receivers shall be provided for the assistiverisig system in accordance with Section
1108.2.6.1.

1108.4.1.4 Employee work stationg.he judge’s bench, clerk’s station, bailiff's stat]
deputy clerk’s station and court reporter’s stasball be located on an accessible route.
The vertical access to elevated employee workostativithin a courtroom is not required
at the time of initial construction, provided a @niift or elevator complying with ICC
A117.1 can be installed without requiring reconfegion or extension of the courtroom or
extension of the electrical system.

1108.4.1.5 Other work stationsThe litigant’s and counsel stations, includingléetern,
shall be accessible in accordance with ICC A117.1.”

(44) Section 1203.8 amended to read as follows:

“1203.3 Ventilation and moisture control. The under-floor space between the bottom of the
structural floor sheathing and the earth under portion of a building with living or
conditioned space above shall be provided withilaiun using the methods and materials as
prescribed hereunder.

1203.3.1 Ventilation Under-floor spaces shall be ventilated as prieedrin 1203.3.
Where such spaces are ventilated by a dedicatetihaonsly operated fan-powered

28



ventilation system, such fans shall be of the tygmpiired by Section 1211.11.1.1 for
radon-resistant construction methods. Sufficienkenap air shall be provided from the
conditioned spaces in the building by outsiderd@ts in the HVAC return-air system, heat
recovery ventilators or by approved methods comsige¢he impact of negative pressures
created by exhaust fans, clothes dryers and siagilpliances.

1203.3.2 Under-floor spaces beneath above-gradedts. Under-floor spaces directly
below floors that are located entirely above gt be ventilated by one of the methods
as set forth in 1203.3.2. Exposed ground surfasei@h spaces shall be covered with an
approved vapor and soil-gas retarder materiajokits in the retarder shall be overlapped
by 6 inches (153 mm) and sealed or taped, withetagder edges extending a minimum of
6 inches (153 mm) up the foundation wall and atdcdnd sealed thereto in an approved
manner.

1203.3.2.1. Non-conditioned under-floor space®here thermally-isolated above-
grade floor systems are insulated and sealed tedukat loss and air infiltration from
non-conditioned under-floor spaces below, as piesdr by the 2006
INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CQ®#Eerior ventilation openings
may be used provided that such spaces do not noHMAC appliances and the
ventilation can be provided directly through opgsinn an exterior wall. The
minimum total net free area of exterior ventilatiopenings shall not be less than
1/1,500 of the floor area of the under-floor sp&penings shall be placed so as to
provide cross-ventilation of the space ahdll be covered for their height and width
with any of the following materials provided thhaetleast dimension of the covering
shall not exceed 1/4 inch (6.4 mm).

1. Perforated sheet metal plates not less thaf® 0n@h (1.8 mm) thick.

2. Expanded sheet metal plates not less than @@47{1.2 mm) thick.

3. Cast iron grills or grating.

4. Extruded load-bearing brick vents.

5. Hardware cloth of 0.035 inch (0.89 mm) wire eatier.

6. Corrosion-resistant wire mesh, with the leastedision being 1/8 inch (3.2
mm).

1203.3.2.2. Conditioned under-floor space®Vhere the perimeter walls enclosing
conditioned under-floor spaces regulated under B2Pare thermally insulated and
sealed to reduce air infiltration as prescribethe006 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY
CONSERVATION CODEventilation of the under-floor space shall beamplished
by approved methods including a continuously ogeratechanical ventilation at the
rate of 1.0 cfm (1.02 L/s) for each 50 square (&6tnt) of under floor space floor
area, or by conditioned air supplied from the doddHVAC system either indirectly
through air-transfer openings or directly througpy-air ducts.

1203.3.3 Under-floor spaces beneath below-gradedis. Under-floor spaces that are

29



located partially or entirely below grade, and dilgabove which in the conditioned space
on the floor above fuel-burning environmental orvese-water heating equipment is
installed, such equipment shall be power ventedi@ct vented (closed combustion
chamber) appliances as defined in the City Mecla@ode. Such under-floor spaces and
under-floor spaces located such that ventilatiomnoa be provided directly through
exterior wall openings, shall be provided with viation and space conditioning by a
continuously operated fan-powered ventilation sydfeat provides ventilation at a rate of
7.5 cfm per person plus 0.01 cfm per square fotutaf conditioned floor area in the home
computed on the basis of two occupants for thellieslroom and one occupant for each
additional bedroom.

The vent pipe served by the ventilation fan shaktdnstructed in accordance with Section
1211.5.1 for radon-resistant construction methadset that the intake inlet for such vent
riser pipe may be located above the gas-retarderhrame and at least 60 inches (1525
mm) from the nearest transfer floor opening. Tim@ke inlet shall be covered with
corrosion-resistant wire mesh having openings thHeast dimension being 1/8 inch (3.2
mm).

A minimum of one transfer floor opening shall beyaded above the ventilated space for
every 250 square feet of under-floor space or pottiereof. The openings shall be sized
by dividing the fan ventilation rate by the totaimber of openings and determining the
opening size based on Table 1203.3. See Figure 3 2Dgfor transfer floor detail.

Exceptions:
1.Engineered systems that maintain the relativeiditymso that all surfaces in such under-
floor spaces have a surface humidity level no grehtan 70%.

2.Engineered non-cellulose and other approved amcgloor systems designed to be a
sealed system shall not require ventilation whemoston of the system components has
been considered and mitigated, assuming that thiemam required structural integrity of
such components is to be maintained for the liffnefbuilding.

The ground surface of the under floor space sleatblvered with a vapor retarder material.

The vapor retarder shall be a minimum 10-mil neinforced polyethylene sheet when
tested in accordance with ASTM E154-99. The shiall be continuously sealed in an
approved manner to the foundation walls, to theriot caissons or footing pads, plumbing
lines and at all laps of multiple sheets. See EdL203.3 (2).

30



Table 1203.3

Exhaust Rate/Transfer
Opening (cfm) Opening Size, net free area
0-10 1.51t0 2.4 sq. in. (1-3/8” to 1-3/4” dia. hole)
11-15 2.4 t0 3.6 s@. in. (1-3/4” to 2-1/8” dia, hole)
16-20 3.6 t0 4.4 sqg. in. (2-1/8” to 2-3/8” dia. hole)

Figure 1203.3 (1)
Floor Transfer Detail

() TRANSFER 6" MIN. CLEARANCE—==| - /1/ . T
OPENING FACE , .
1 . ) 4
- CONDIMORED — — K% 77 7 T
AN L A% IR
REMOVE DAMPER o
& LEVER ‘
PROVIDE ROUGH OPENING :
IN FLOOR DECK TO a A
_/- FORCE-FIT REGISTER. DO [ . . 4 o
NOT PENETRATE FLOOR : :
FLOOR BOX/ : S 4
RECEPTACLEG)_ STRUCTURAL MEMBERS. ‘ e A
DRILLED HOLE, DIAMETER PER - ‘ . g .
! CONCRETE | -4 _° 4
. FOUNDATION | _ -
I NN, 17 P WALL . ‘
________ N <- . ' ‘ ’
[BELOW—GRADE 1 - .4 7
[UNDER—FLOOR_SPACE | 4 /L R
NOTES:

@ FLOOR AIR TRANSFER ASSEMBLY:
STANDARD FLOOR REGISTER OR GRILLE. MODIFY AS FOLLOWS:
DAMPER LEVER: REMOVE DAMPER ACTUATION LEVER (IF PRESENT).
% DAMPER: REMOVE DAMPER IF PRESENT.
@ PROVIDE SHEET METAL "BOX", SAME SIZE AS GRILLE OR REGISTER FLANGE.
@ PROVIDE CUT OR DRILLED SHARP EDGE HOLE IN SIDE OF BOX CLOSEST TO FOUNDATION WALL AS FOLLOWS:
@ NET OPENING THROUGH TRANSFER: IN ACCORDANCE WITH TABLE IV.J.
@ "BOX"” SHALL PROVIDE CODE INTENT FOR NON-COMBUSTIBLE RECEPTACLE IN ACCORDANCE WITH UMC 607 & IRC
M1601.4.3. RECEPTACLE SHALL HAVE MINIMUM 17" VERTICAL LIP.

ALL TRANSFER OPENINGS SHALL BE THE SAME CROSS—SECTIONAL AREA +/- 10%.

DETAIL SHOWN IS SUGGESTED MEANS OF ACHIEVING SPECIFIED NET TRANSFER OPENING AREA AND
RECEPTACLE. ALTERNATE MEANS OF ACHIEVING THESE GOALS MAY BE USED AT DESIGNER'S OPTION.

TABLE IV.J: FREE AREA OF OPENING IN FLOOR BOX

EXHAUST RATE PER
R PR TENRR NET FREE AREA/HOLE DIAMETER
0.0 CEM NOT APPLICABLE - TRANSFER AT LEAST
10 CFM THROUGH EACH OPENING
1770 2.6 SQ.IN. FREE AREA /
10-15 CFM (1-5/8” @ drilled hole)
267037 S5Q.IN.FREE AREA J
16-20 CFM (2’ @ drilled hole)
3770 47 8Q.IN. FREE AREA J
21-25 CFM (2-1/4” & drilled hole)
7T058SQ.IN. FREE AREA J
26-30 CFM (2-1/2” @ drilled hole)

31



Figure 1203.3 (2)

FIRST FLOOR

TERMINATE DRAINS
DIRECTLY ABOVE

FLOOR FIXTURES. L

ALLOW WETTED DECKING
TO DRY BEFORE
FINISHING FLOOR.

BASEMENT STRUCTURAL FLOOR

I |

PROVIDE MINIMUM
CLEARANCE BETWEEN
BOTTOM OF PIPE AND
EARTH (WHERE PIPE
CROSSES BELOW BQOTTOM
OF STRUCTURE).

VQID HT.
+ 4" BELOW
BEAM

VAPOR RETARDER.

B

R T e T s

CONTROL MOISTURE OF SOILS DURING
CONSTRUCTION.  {SECTION VI.N.): RE—GRADE
AND CLEAN SURFACE OF SOIL PRIOR TO
INSTALLATION OF VAPOR RETARDER

EXTEND VAPOR BARRIER UP INTERIOR CONCRETE CAISSONS
OR FOOTINGS. SEAL TO CONCRETE. DO NOT COVER
STEEL OR STRUCTURAL WOOD MATERIAL. ATTACH AWAY
FROM COLUMN TO ALLOW THE CONCRETE TO BREATH.

32

ST~

PROVIDE FLASHING
SYSTEMS TO DRAIN WATER
AWAY FROM BUILDING
OPENINGS.

PROVIDE POSITIVE GRADE
AWAY FROM BUILDING PER
GEQTECHNICAL
RECOMMENDATIONS

CONSIDER THE USE OF
EXTERNAL INSULATION TO
RAISE THE INSIDE SURFACE
TEMPERATURE QF THE
FOUNDATION WALL (TO
REDUCE CONDENSATION),
ESPECIALLY IN GARDEN
LEVEL OR WALKOUT
BASEMENTS.

INTERIOR INSULATION WITHIN
BELOW- GRADE UNDER-FLOOR
SPACE NOT RECOMMENDED.

SEAL RETARDER TQ WALL.
ALTERNATE: EXTEND RETARDER
TO TOP OF FLOOR FULLY
BEHIND LEDGER OR RIM JOIST.

FOUNDATION/ BASEMENT WALL PER
GEQTECH AND STRUCTURAL DIVISION
RECOMMENDATIONS

COVER VOID FORM WITH VAPOR
RETARDER

INTERIOR OR EXTERIOR PERIMETER
DRAIN SYSTEM PER GEOTECH
RECOMMENDATIONS



1203.3.4 AccessAccess shall be provided to all under-floor ggacAccess openings
through the floor shall be a minimum of 18 inchg=28 inches (457 mm by 610 mm).
Openings through a perimeter wall shall be 16 isd¢he24 inches (407 mm by 610 mm).
When any portion of the through-wall access isWwajoade, an areaway of not less than 16
inches by 24 inches (407 mm by 610 mm) shall beiged. The bottom of the areaway
shall be below the threshold of the access opeflihgbugh-wall access openings shall not
be located under a door to the building. See Sed®®9.3 for access requirements where
mechanical equipment is located under floors.

Exception: Engineered non-cellulose and other approved imicg#oor systems
designed to be a sealed system shall not requiilateon when corrosion of the
system components has been considered and adgouétgated, assuming that the
minimum required structural integrity of such compaots is to be maintained for the
life of the building.

1203.3.5 Vapor retarders.Class | or Il vapor retarders are required onrtezior side of
frame walls.

Exceptions:

1. Basement walls.

2. Below grade portion of any wall.

3. Construction where moisture or its freezing wdt damage the materials.

1203.3.5.1 Class Il vapor retardersClass Ill vapor retarders shall be permitted
where any one of the conditions are met:

1. Vented cladding over OSB

2. Vented cladding over Plywood

3. Vented cladding over Fiberboard

4. Vented cladding over Gypsum

5. Insulated sheathing with R-valeer5 over 2x4 wall
6. Insulated sheathing with R-valeer7.5 over 2x6 wall

1203.3.5.2 Material vapor retarder classThe vapor retarder class shall be based on
the manufacturer’s testing or a tested assemblyfdltowing shall be deemed to meet
the class specified:

1. Class I: Sheet polyethylene, non-perforated adum foil

2. Class lI: Kraft faced fiberglass batts or lowmpeaint (paint with 0.1 < perm
<=1.0

3. Class lll: Latex or enamel paint

33



1203.3.5.3 Minimum clear air spaces and vented opegs for vented claddingFor
the purposes of this section vented cladding ghalide the following minimum clear
air spaces. Other openings with the equivalent asd permitted.

1. Vinyl lap or horizontal aluminum siding applieder a weather-resistive
barrier as specified in Table R703.4 of theernational Residential Code

2. Brick veneer with a clear airspace as specifieHection R703.7.4.2 of the
International Residential Code

3. Other approved vented claddings.”

(45) CHAPTER 12 — INTERIOR ENVIRONMENY amended by adding a new section at the
end thereof to read as follows:

“SECTION 1211 — RADON-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION

1211.1.1 Title.These provisions shall be known the Fort Collins Radon-Resistant
Construction Code For Group R Division 2 Buildirigad shall be cited as such and will
be referred to herein as 'this code.’

1211.1.2 Scopelhe provisions of this code shall apply to new tidiaimily dwellings.

1211.1.3 PurposeThe purpose of this code is to provide minimumunements to
enhance the public safety, health and general weglthrough construction methods
designed and installed to resist entry of radonimgfasthe occupied spaces of buildings
regulated by this code.

SECTION 1211.2 - DEFINITIONS

1211.2.1 GeneralFor the purpose of these requirements, the tesed ghall be
defined as follows:

FOUNDATION DRAIN SYSTEM. A continuous length of drain tile, perforated pipe
or filter mat extending around all or part of tiiernal or external perimeter of a
basement or crawl space footing designed to caledtdrain away excess subsurface
water.

RADON. A naturally occurring, chemically inert, radioagtigas that is not detectable
by human senses. As a gas, it can move readilyghrparticles of soil and rock and

can accumulate under the slabs and foundationsméhk where it can easily enter the
living space through construction cracks and opgsin

SOIL-GAS-RETARDER. A continuous membrane of 3-mil (0.075 mm) croekdd
polyethylene or other equivalent material usecetard the flow of soil gases into a
building.

SUBFLOOR. A concrete slab and other approved permanentsigiem that directly
contacts the ground and is within the walls ofliieg spaces of the building.

34



SUB-MEMBRANE DEPRESSURIZATION SYSTEM. A system designed to
achieve lower sub-membrane air pressure relatigeaiol space air pressure by use of
a vent drawing air from beneath the soil-gas-retandembrane.

SUB-SLAB DEPRESSURIZATION SYSTEM (Passive).A system designed to
achieve lower sub-slab air pressure relative toanair pressure by use of a vent pipe
routed through the conditioned space of a builédind connecting the sub-slab area
with outdoor air, thereby relying on the convectil®v of air upward in the vent to
draw air from beneath the slab.

SECTION 1211.3 - REQUIREMENTS

1211.3.1 GeneralThe following required construction methods atemmaled to resist
radon entry and prepare the building for post-aoietion radon mitigation.

1211.3.2 Subfloor preparation.A layer of gas-permeable material shall be placed
under all subfloors. The gas-permeable layer daibkist of one of the following
methods except that where fills of aggregate sige than that described in Method 1
are used beneath a slab, Method 2,3, 4, or 5 neusséd.

1. A uniform layer of clean aggregate, a minimum afches (102 mm) thick. The
aggregate shall consist of material that will passugh a 2-inch (51 mm) sieve
and be retained by a ¥4 -inch (6.4 mm) sieve. lidngs where interior footings or

other barriers separate sub-grade areas, penes#ti@ugh the interior footing or

barrier equal to a minimum of 12 square inches)@r&) per 10 feet (3.048 m) of

barrier length shall be provided. A minimum of tpenetrations shall be provided
per separation and be evenly spaced along theatepar

Exception: In buildings where interior footings or other bard separate the
sub-grade area, separate radon vent pipes magtadied for each sub-grade
area as specified in Section 1211.5.2 in lieu akpations through the barrier.

2. A foundation drain pipe system installed unaeroeete floor slab areas less than
2,000 square feet (1869nconsisting of a continuous loop of minimum 3kr{é6
mm) diameter perforated pipe shall be laid in thie-grade with the top of pipe
located 1 inch (25.4 mm) below the concrete slale. dipe may be rigid or flexible
but shall have perforations fully around the ciréerance with a free air space
equal to 1.83 square inches per square foot (12/héjof exterior pipe surface
area. Such pipe shall be wrapped with approvest fittaterial to prevent blocking
of pipe perforations. The pipe loop shall be lodatside of the exterior perimeter
foundation walls not more than 12 inches (305 nrotnfthe perimeter foundation
walls. In buildings where interior footings or otharriers separate the sub-grade
area, the loop of pipe shall penetrate, or passdibnsuch interior footings or
barriers. For slab areas greater than 2,000 séeetrél86 m) but less than 4,000
square feet (372 ) the preceding configuration may be used, pravide
minimum of 4-inch diameter (102 mm) pipe is ingdll Slabs in excess of 4,000

35



square feet (372 fshall have under them separate loops for evetitiadal
2,000 square feet (186°)f slab area when 3-inch (76 mm) diameter pipesési;
or, slabs may have separate loops provided for addtional increment in area
between 2,000 square feet (186 mnd 4,000 square feet (372)mvhen 4-inch
(102 mm) diameter pipe is used.

3. A foundation drain soil gas collection mat sysiastalled under concrete floor
slab areas of 2,000 square feet (189§ or less, consisting of a continuous
rectilinear loop of soil gas collection mat or a@ge mat having minimum
dimensions of 1 inch in height by 12 inches in Wif®5.4 mm in height x 305 mm
in width) and a nominal cross-sectional air flowanof 12 square inches (0.0078
m?) may be laid on top of the sub-grade. The mat Sieatonstructed of a matrix
that allows for the movement of air through it @@ capable of supporting the
concrete placed upon it. The matrix shall be caveseapproved filter material on
all four sides to prevent dirt or concrete fromegimyg the matrix. All breaches and
joints in the filter material shall be repairedqurio the placement of the slab. The
loop shall be located inside the exterior perimé&tandation walls and within 12
inches (305 mm) from the perimeter foundation watiduildings where interior
footings or other barriers separate the sub-greske the mat shall penetrate these
interior footings or barriers to form a continuoles®p around the exterior
perimeter.

Slabs larger than 2,000 square feet (18pbut less than 4,000 square feet (372
m?) shall have under them an additional strip of that bisects the loop forming
two areas approximately equally divided by the hatves of the rectilinear loop.
Slabs larger than 4,000 square feet (372 shall have separate loops for each
2,000 (186 ) square feet; or, increased to 4,000 square3@ath2) when a loop

is bisected as specified in the preceding configuma

4. A uniform layer of sand (native or fill), a mmum of 4 inches (102 mm) thick,
overlain by a layer or strips of geo-textile dragjaanatting designed to allow the
lateral flow of soil gases.

5. Other materials, systems or floor designs watmdnstrated capability to permit
depressurization across the entire sub-floor area.

1211.3.3 Entry routesPotential radon entry routes shall be closed tom@ance with
Sections 1211.3.4.1 through 1211.3.4.8

1211.3.3.1 Floor openingsOpenings around bathtubs, showers, water closets,
pipes, wires or other objects that penetrate comstabs or other floor assemblies
shall be filled with a polyurethane caulk or eqleve sealant applied in accordance
with the manufacturer's recommendations.

1211.3.3.2 Concrete jointsAll control joints, isolation joints, constructignmints
and any other joints in concrete slabs or betwésdrs and foundation walls shall

36



be sealed with a caulk or sealant. Gaps and jshah be cleared of loose material
and filled with polyurethane caulk or other elastoim sealant applied in
accordance with the manufacturer's recommendations.

1211.3.3.3 Condensate draingCondensate drains shall be trapped or routed
through non-perforated pipe to daylight.

1211.3.3.4 SumpsSump pits open to soil or serving as the termamagioint for
sub-slab or exterior drain tile loops shall be cedewith a gasketed or otherwise
sealed lid. Sumps used as the suction point irbasklb depressurization system
shall have a lid designed to accommodate the vipet umps used as a floor
drain shall have a lid equipped with a trappedtinle

1211.3.3.5 Foundation wallsHollow block masonry foundation walls shall be
constructed with either a continuous course ofdsatiasonry, one course of
masonry grouted solid, or a solid concrete beanaliove finished ground surface
to prevent passage of air from the interior oftladl into the living space. Where a
brick veneer or other masonry ledge is installee course immediately below that
ledge shall be sealed. Joints, cracks or otheringemround all penetrations of
both exterior and interior surfaces of masonry kloc wood foundation walls
below the ground surface shall be filled with posthane caulk or equivalent
sealant. Penetrations of concrete walls shallllssifi

1211.3.3.6 Dampproofing.The exterior surfaces of portions of concrete and
masonry block walls below the ground surface slwal damp-proofed in
accordance with Section 1807.

1211.3.3.7 Air-handling units.Air-handling units in crawl spaces shall be sealed
to prevent air from being drawn into the unit.

Exception: Units with gasketed seams or units that are otlseragealed by the
manufacturer to prevent leakage.

1211.3.3.8 DuctsDuctwork passing through or beneath a slab skalf beamless
material unless the air-handling system is desigmethintain continuous positive
pressure within such ducting. Joints in such dudtwsball be sealed to prevent air
leakage. Ductwork located in crawl spaces shaklahseams and joints sealed by
closure systems in accordance with ltiiternational Mechanical Code.

1211.3.4 Sub-membrane depressurization systentn buildings with interior
structural floors directly above under-floor spao@staining exposed soil surfaces that

37



are not protected by a sub-slab depressurizatstersy the following components of
sub-membrane depressurization system shall bdl@tstiuring construction.

Exception: Buildings in which an approved mechanical ventiatisystem
complying with Section 1203 or such other equivileystem that provides
equivalent depressurization across the entire seitdinane area as determined by
the building official is installed in the under-fiospaces.

1211.3.4.1 Ventilation.Crawl spaces and similar under-floor spaces dell
provided with ventilation complying with Sectiona2

1211.3.4.2 Soil-gas-retarderThe exposed soil in under-floor spaces shall be
covered with a continuous layer of soil-gas-retar8ach groundcover joints shall
overlap 6 inches (152 mm) and be sealed or tageelediges of the groundcover
shall extend a minimum of 6 inches (152 mm) up catofoundation walls
enclosing the under-floor space and shall be ath@nd sealed to foundation
walls in an approved manner.

1211.3.4.3/ent pipe riser. A plumbing tee or other approved connection dbell
inserted horizontally beneath the sheeting andexted to a 3- or 4-inch-diameter
(76 mm or 102 mm) fitting with a vertical vent pimstalled through the sheeting.
The vent pipe shall be extended up through thelimgjfloors, terminate at least 12
inches (305 mm) above the roof in a location atlé8 feet (3.048 m) away from
any window or other opening into the conditionedcgs of the building that is less
than 2 feet (0.610 m) below the exhaust point, Hhdeet (3.048 m) from any
window or other opening in adjoining or adjacenidings.

1211.3.5 Sub-slab depressurization systeifhe following components of a sub-slab
depressurization system shall be installed durimgtruction under basement or slab-
on-grade floors.

1211.5.1 Vent pipe riserA minimum 3-inch-diameter (76 mm) ABS, PVC or
equivalent gas-tight pipe shall be embedded vélgticdo the sub-slab aggregate
or other permeable material before the slab is. @st" fitting or equivalent
method shall be used to ensure that the pipe ogpeemains within the sub-slab
permeable material. Alternatively, the 3-inch (7&)mpipe shall be inserted
directly into an interior perimeter drain tile loop through a sealed sump cover
where the sump is exposed to the sub-slab aggregatenected to it through a
drainage system.

All vent pipes shall be extended up through thédmug floors, terminate at least
12 inches (305 mm) above the surface of the roaf iacation at least 10 feet

38



(3.048 m) away from any window, air intake, or atbeening into the conditioned
spaces of the building that is less than 2 fe@&l(@®m) below the exhaust point,
and 10 feet (3.048 m) from any window or other opgin adjoining or adjacent
buildings. The discharge end of vent pipe termoraishall be unobstructed and
protected from small animal entry with a corrosresistant screen having
openings between % inch (6.4 mm) and % inch (12v§.m

1211.3.5.2 Multiple vent pipeslin buildings where interior footings or other
barriers separate the sub-slab aggregate or cikggeymeable material, each area
shall be fitted with an individual vent pipe. Vampes shall connect to a single
vent that terminates above the roof or each indalidrent pipe shall terminate
separately above the roof.

1211.3.6 Vent pipe drainageAll components of the radon vent pipe system dieall
installed to provide positive drainage to the guleneath the slab or soil-gas
retarder.

1211.3.7 Vent pipe accessibilityRadon vent pipes shall be accessible for fan
installation through an attic or other area outsisehabitable space.

Exception: The radon vent pipe need not be accessible int@space where an
approved roof-top electrical supply is provided.

1211.3.8 Vent pipe identification and notification All exposed and visible interior
radon vent pipes shall be conspicuously identifigd at least one label on each floor
and in attics provided with access openings. Thellghall read substantially as
follows: 'Radon Reduction System.' In additiontte preceding label, a notice shall be
placed in a conspicuous area near the vent pipéatiades the following statement:

‘THIS RADON REDUCTION SYSTEM IS NOT REQUIRED TO BEESTED AND
IS A'PASSIVE' SYSTEM, RELYING ENTIRELY ON NATURANENTILATION.

OCCUPANTS ARE ADVISED TO TEST FOR RADON AND TAKE REEDIAL

ACTION AS NECESSARY BY INSTALLING A CONTINUOUSLY OBRATING
FAN LOCATED IN THE VENT PIPE (ACCESS TYPICALLY PRONED IN THE
ATTIC) AND CONNECTED TO THE NEARBY PROVIDED ELECTRIAL
OUTLET. CALL 1-800-767-RADON FOR MORE INFORMATION.’

1211.3.9 Combination foundationsCombination basement/crawl! space or slab-on-
grade/crawl space foundations shall have sepadtrvent pipes installed in each
type of foundation area. Each radon vent pipe séatlinate above the roof or shall be
connected to a single vent that terminates abayecibf.

39



1211.3.10 Building depressurization.Joints in air ducts and plenums in
unconditioned spaces shall be substantially ant #gnd permanently sealed with an
approved sealant, mastic, or other approved metfit@smal envelope air infiltration
requirements shall comply with the energy consewaprovisions in the energy
conservation code currently enacted by the Citggtopping shall be in conformance
with the most recent general building code enabtethe City.

1211.3.11 Provisions for future depressurization fa installation. Permanent
provisions shall be made for the future installatwd an in-line fan to be connected to
every radon vent pipe. Such designated fan locasiball be outside of the conditioned
envelope of the building, such as in the atticagarand similar locations, excluding
crawl spaces and other interior under-floor spad@ssignated locations shall
accommodate an unobstructed permanent cylindripates with the following
minimum dimensions: 12 inches (305 mm) measureidlipéround the radon vent
pipe along a vertical distance of 30 inches (760 nbasignated fan locations shall be
permanently accessible for servicing and maintemafn electrical circuit shall be
provided within 4 feet (1.219 m) of and within sigitom designated fan locations.
Such circuit shall have a means of positive disegtion and be terminated in an
approved electrical outlet in accordance with theliaable current electric code.

1211.3.11.1 Depressurization fan system activatiowhen a passive system as
constructed in accordance with this code is todmeerted to an active system, an
approved in-line fan shall be installed in a deatgd fan location as specified in
Section 1211.11.1. Additionally, an approved peremalectric light fixture and
in-line pipe couplings that facilitate fan replacarhshall be provided. The in-line
fan shall be designed to operate continuously feréod of not less than five years
and have a minimum air-flow rating as establishgdhe building official. A
readily accessible manometer or other approved imgirdevice that notifies
occupants of a fan malfunction by a visible or alelisignal shall be installed
within the dwelling unit.”

40



(46) CHAPTER 13 — ENERGY EFFICIENGYrenamed, “ENERGY-EFFICIENT DESIGN AND
CONSTRUCTION", and is further amended to read devis:

“SECTION 1301 - GENERAL

1301.1 Scope and purposeFor the purpose of establishing minimum requireimen
concerning the minimum energy-efficiency of eveuyidiing regulated by this code, including
its systems; new portions of such existing buildargl their related systems; and to new
systems and equipment in such existing buildinggrewuilding shall be designed and
constructed according 2006 International Energy Conservation Caaeamended by the
city.

1301.2. Exterior and interior local design parametes. The following local design
parameters shall be used:

Winter Outdoor, Design Dry-bullSK) =4
Winter Indoor, Design Dry-bul5'F) =72
Summer, Outdoor Design Dry-bultFj =89
Summer, Indoor Design Dry-bulfF) =75
Summer, Design Wet-bulBR) =62
Degree days heating = 6368
Degree days cooling =479

{For SI:°C = [(°F)-32)/1.8.}

(47) Section 1503.45 amended to read as follows:

“1503.4 Roof drainage Design and installation of roof drainage systenasl glomply with
Section 1503 and tHaternational Plumbing Code

1503.4.1 Secondary drainage requiredecondary (emergency) roof drains or scuppers
shall be provided where the roof perimeter conssnextends above the roof in such a
manner that water may be entrapped if the primeaind allow buildup for any reason.

1503.4.2 ScuppersWhen scuppers are used for secondary (emergencfoaveroof
drainage, the quantity, size, location and inlevation of the scuppers shall be sized to
prevent the depth of ponding water from exceediagfor which the roof was designed as
determined by Section 1503.4.1. Scuppers shdtlana an opening dimension of less than
4 inches (102 mm). The flow through the primaryteysshall not be considered when
locating and sizing scuppers.”

(48) Section 1505 — FIRE CLASSIFICATI@Namended in the following respects:

(a) Section 1505.1s amended to read as follows:

41



“1505.1 New Construction. The roof-covering classification on any new stoet
regulated by this code shall be Class A.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Noncombustible roof coverings as defined int®acl507.3, 1507.4, 1507.5 may
be applied in accordance with the manufacturegsipations in lieu of a fire-
retardant roofing assembly.

2. Any Class B or Class C roof covering may bdiadpn any new construction that
is added to an existing building classified as auprR, Division 3 Occupancy,
provided the roof extremities of such existing dunfj and new construction are
located a minimum distance of five (5) feet tortlkarest adjacent property line and
are a minimum distance of ten (10) feet to anobidding.”

(b) Table No. 1505.1, Minimum Roof Covering Classiiara For Types of Constructipn
is deleted.

(49) Section 1507 REQUIREMENTS FOR ROOF COVERINSG&mended in the following
respects:

(a) Section 1507.2.i8 amended by adding a new subsection theretatbas follows:

“1507.2.7.1 Wind resistanceAsphalt shingles shall be tested in accordance eiitier
ASTM D 3161 or ASTM D 7158 for wind resistance. Asfi shingles shall meet the
classification requirements of ASTM D 3161 D ordFASTM D 7158 G or H. Asphalt
shingle packaging shall indicate compliance with tequired classification in Table
1507.2.7."

(b) A new,Subsection1507.16 added at the end thereof to read as follows:

“1507.16 Roof gardens and landscaped roofRoof gardens and landscaped roofs shall
comply with the requirements of this chapter ancties 1607.11.2.2 and 1607.11.2.3.”

(50) Section 1510 — REROOFING amended to read as follows:

“1510.1 General Reroofing.Except as otherwise provided hereunder, rerocfimgl be
applied in accordance with this chapter and sultgetite following conditions:

1. No portion of an existing nonrated roof coverimgy be permanently replaced or
covered with more than one square of nonratedaoweéring.

2. Any existing roof covering system may be reptaegth a roof covering of the same
materials and classification, provided the replasetmoof covering has a minimum
rating of Class C.”

42



(51) Table 1607.1s amended to read as follows:

Table 1607.1 Change table rows 4, 5 and 28 to read as shown and delete row 9 “Decks”: (S9-06/07
Part 1)

TABLE 1607.1 MINIMUM UNIFORMLY DISTRIBUTED
LIVE LOADS AND MINIMUM CONCENTRATED LIVE UNIFORM (psf) | CONCENTRATED (Ibs.)
LOADS OCCUPANCY OR USE

4. Assembly areas and theaters

Fixed seats (fastened to floor) 60

Follow spot, projections, and control rooms 50 NA
Lobbies 100
Movable seats 100
Stages and platforms 125
Other assembly areas 100

5. Balconies (exterior) and decksn Same as NA

occupancy served
28. Residential One- and two-family dwellings:

Uninhabitable attics without storagei 10
Uninhabitable attics with storagei, j, « 20
Habitable attics and sleeping areas 30

All other areas 40 NA

Hotels and multifamily dwellings:

Private rooms and corridors serving them 40
Public rooms and corridors serving them 100

NA — Not Applicable
h. See Section 1604.8.3 for decks attached to exterior walls. (Portions of table and footnotes not shown remain
unchanged)

(52) Section 1608.Zhe first sentence is amended to read in itsetgtas follows:

“1608.2 Ground Snow LoadsBuildings and other structures and all portidres¢of that are
subject to snow loading shall be designed to resish snow loads in accordance with
Appendix Chapter 16, Division |, wherein the 'grdismow loadP, shall be 30 psf.”

(53) Section1609.3is amended to read in its entirety as follows:

“1609.3 "Basic wind speed The minimum basic wind speed for determining glesvind
pressure shall be one hundred (100) miles per (i@ir kph).”

(54) Section 1803.%5 amended by adding a new subsection theretatbas follows:

“1803.2.1 Final Grading. Final grading adjacent to the foundation shallcbenpacted
sufficiently and in such a manner such that is mmadermined or subject to significant
settlement or displacement due to improper placéwfdoackfill.”

43




(55) Section 2302,1the definition ofTREATED WOODs amended to read as follows:

‘“TREATED WOOD. Wood and wood based materials that use vacuumypeess
impregnation processes to enhance fire retardgreservative properties and shall include:
1. Fire-retardant-treated wood. Pressure-treated lumber and plywood that exhibit
reduced surface burning characteristics and rpsigtagation of fire.
2. Preservative-treated wood.Pressure-treated wood products that exhibit reduced
susceptibility to damage by fungi, insects or matorers.”

(56) Section 2304.9.5 amended by addirgubsections 2304.9.5tirough2304.9.5.4hereto to
read as follows:

“2304.9.5.1 Fasteners for preservative-treated woodrasteners for preservative-treated
wood shall be of hot-dipped zinc-coated galvanigesl, stainless steel, silicon bronze or
copper. Fasteners other than nails, timber riveisd screws and lag screws shall be permitted
to be of mechanically deposited zinc-coated ste#l woating weights in accordance with
ASTM B 695, Class 55 minimum.

2304.9.5.2 Fastenings for wood foundationEastenings for wood foundations shall be as
required in AF&PA Technical Report No. 7.

2304.9.5.3 Fasteners for fire-retardant-treated wabused in exterior applications or wet

or damp locations.Fasteners for fire-retardant-treated wood usedterior applications or
wet or damp locations shall be of hot-dipped zinated galvanized steel, stainless steel,
silicon bronze or copper. Fasteners other thas ratiber rivets, wood screws and lag screws
shall be permitted to be of mechanically depostied coated steel with coating weights in
accordance with ASTM B 695, Class 55 minimum.

2304.9.5.4 Fasteners for fire-retardant-treated wab used in interior applications.
Fasteners for fire-retardant treated wood useat@rior locations shall be in accordance with
the manufacturer's recommendations. In the absehoeanufacturer's recommendations,
Section 2304.9.5.3 shall apply.”

(57) Section 2406.8em 5is amended to read as follows:

“5. Glazing in doors and enclosures for hot tubisirhvools, saunas, steam rooms, bathtubs
and showers. Glazing in any portion of a buildingllvenclosing these compartments
where the bottom exposed edge of the glazing ssthean 60 inches (1524 mm) above a
standing surface and where any portion of suchrgidg within forty-eight (48) inches of
an interior surface of a tub.”

44



(58) Section 2902.is amended by adding a new subsection theretanb as follows:

“2902.1.2 Touch-free toilet facilitiesToilet facilities installed for occupancies assteih

with food preparation or food service to the pukhall be provided with:

1. Automatic touch-free water control valves ovalaries.

2. Automatic touch-free paper towel dispensers.

3. Automatic flush controls on urinals and toilids.

4. Tollet facilities exit doors that allow exitingthout requiring touching by hand, any door
hardware, such as knobs, levers, sliding boltsh&d and similar devices.

Exception: Toilet facilities designed as a single occupantraag be provided with exit
door locking hardware to afford privacy.”

(59) Sections 3108.1 and 310&&amended to read as follows:

“3108.1 GeneralTowers shall be designed and constructed in acooedaith the provisions
of TIA-222.

3108.2 Location and acces$owers shall be located such that guy wires aner @ttcessories
shall not cross or encroach upon any street or ptitdic space, or over above-ground electric
utility lines, or encroach upon any privately owmpedperty without the written consent of the
owner of the encroached-upon property, space oregsound electric utility lines. Towers
shall be equipped with climbing and working fac# in compliance with TIA-222. Access to
the tower sites shall be limited as required byliapple OSHA, FCC and EPA regulations.”

(60) Appendix C GROUP BGRICULTURAL BUILDING$s adopted in its entirety.

(61) Appendix E SUPPLEMENTARY ACCESSIBILITY REQUIREMEIN B8opted in its
entirety.

(62) Appendix | PATIO COVERS adopted in its entirety.

45



Section 3. That Section 5-28 of the Code of thg @fifrort Collins is hereby amended
to read as follows:

Sec. 5-28. Defintions.

The following words, terms and phrases, when usédticle 1l of this chapter and in
any code adopted by reference therein, shall Heveneanings ascribed to them in this Section:

Whenever the worthunicipality, jurisdiction or city is used, it shall mean the City of
Fort Collins.

Whenever the-werterm Building-codeOfficial or Code Officialis used, the term shall
be synonymous with “Director efBuilding-and-Zeningighborhood and Building Servicegf
authorized representative.

Section 4. That all of the foregoing changes erklotethis Ordinance shall become
effective for implementation commencing July 1, 200

Introduced, considered favorably on first readenyg ordered published in summary form
this 6th day of May A.D. 2008, and to be presemtedinal passage on the 20th day of May A.D.
2008.

Mayor

ATTEST:

City Clerk

Passed and adopted on final reading this @8y of May, A.D. 2004,

Mayor

ATTEST:

City Clerk
46



a7



